
ProRFx ID: RFQ02022400000018

Notifications Sent: 223

Bids: 15

Milclean USA
Serviamigos 

Solutions, LLC

American Facility 

Services, Inc. 

Southern Cleaning 

Services, Inc. 

American 

Janitorial, Inc. 

Outliers Capital 

SMB, LLC

Purpose Driven 

Cleaning 

Solutions, LLC

Owens, Renz & 

Lee Co., Inc. 

Attention to 

Detail Executive 

Cleaning Services, 

Bright Corners, 

Inc.

Heavenly Touch 

Cleaning, LLC

Wise Guys 

Cleaning 

Solutions

Stockton 

Maintenance 

Group, LLC

First Coast 

Franchising, LLC

DGA Cleaning 

Services, LLC

Orlando, FL Ocala, FL Apharetta, GA Jacksonville, FL Umatilla, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL Orlando, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL Ocala, FL West Palm Beach, FL Jacksonville, FL Jacksonville, FL

7 days per week

Monday – Sunday

1 day per week

Friday

1 day per week

Wednesday

1 day per week

Monday

1 day per week

Monday

1 day per week

Wednesday

525.21$            729.00$               754.25$                     770.00$                   827.06$           866.25$                870.00$                 894.88$              955.00$                1,040.00$           1,060.00$          1,135.00$           1,990.66$            3,324.27$              11,555.00$          

54,621.84$       75,816.00$           78,442.00$                80,080.00$              86,014.24$       90,090.00$           90,480.00$            93,067.52$         99,320.00$           108,160.00$       110,240.00$      118,040.00$       207,028.64$        345,724.08$          1,201,720.00$     

Item Building Name Price Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost

7 800.00$            867.00$                 375.00$                      675.00$                    800.00$             650.00$                 No Bid 550.00$               No Bid 1,750.00$             1,200.00$           1,200.00$            1,695.00$             2,450.00$               3,000.00$             

Item
Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance
Price Per Occurance Price Per Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

Price Per 

Occurance

8 180.00$            463.00$                 150.00$                      325.00$                    200.00$             300.00$                 No Bid 700.00$               No Bid 480.00$               600.00$              700.00$               675.00$                275.00$                  8,755.00$             

Item Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF) Price (per SF)

9 0.28$                0.79$                    0.42$                          0.65$                        0.45$                0.75$                     0.35$                      0.52$                   No Bid 0.96$                   1.25$                  1.75$                   0.79$                    0.45$                      8.00$                    

10 0.37$                0.71$                    0.28$                          0.65$                        0.42$                0.50$                     1.25$                      0.32$                   No Bid 0.60$                   1.25$                  1.75$                   3.00$                    0.35$                      3.00$                    

11 0.42$                0.71$                    0.48$                          0.65$                        0.32$                0.50$                     1.25$                      0.25$                   No Bid 1.25$                   1.25$                  1.75$                   8.99$                    0.35$                      4.00$                    

12 0.37$                0.71$                    0.28$                          0.65$                        0.22$                0.50$                     1.25$                      0.25$                   No Bid 0.60$                   1.25$                  1.75$                   0.80$                    0.35$                      5.00$                    

Item Cost/ Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour Price Per Hour

13 20.00$              25.00$                  32.00$                        25.00$                      28.00$              25.00$                   75.00$                    33.71$                 No Bid 65.00$                 100.00$              75.00$                 62.50$                  28.00$                    225.00$                

92.23$                    

128.82$                  

WEEKLY PRICE

5,480.00$             

1,300.00$             

1,300.00$             

875.00$                

1,300.00$             

1,300.00$             

WEEKLY PRICE

2,451.00$               

145.75$                  

219.97$                  

286.50$                  

40.00$                 

75.00$                 

WEEKLY PRICE

1,421.88$             

101.57$                

101.57$                

142.19$                

101.57$                

121.88$                

WEEKLY PRICE

780.00$               

100.00$               

80.00$                 

60.00$                 

60.00$                 

55.00$                 

WEEKLY PRICE

725.00$              

100.00$              

75.00$                

60.00$                

40.00$                

60.00$                

WEEKLY PRICE

750.00$               

60.00$                 

55.00$                 

60.00$                 

55.00$                    

55.00$                    

WEEKLY PRICE

630.00$                 

75.00$                   

75.00$                   

75.00$                   

25.00$                   

75.00$                   

WEEKLY PRICE

822.98$               

14.38$                 

14.38$                 

14.38$                 

14.38$                 

14.38$                 

WEEKLY PRICE

550.00$                  

55.00$                    

55.00$                    

100.00$                  

17.34$              

37.38$              

WEEKLY PRICE

649.50$                 

51.00$                   

51.00$                   

38.25$                   

38.25$                   

38.25$                   

WEEKLY PRICE

553.85$             

55.38$              

74.49$              

88.62$              

595.00$                    

50.00$                      

30.00$                      

25.00$                      

WEEKLY PRICE

546.00$                      

36.75$                        

49.00$                        

24.50$                        

2-YEAR TOTAL PRICE

558.00$                 

33.00$                  

35.00$                  

33.00$                  

35.00$                  

35.00$                  

375.21$            

30.00$              

30.00$              

30.00$              

30.00$              

30.00$              

9:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.

7:00 a.m.- 12:00 p.m.

7:00 a.m. – 12:00 

p.m.

9:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.

45.00$                      

25.00$                      

LVT – Deep Cleaning

Emergency Cleaning - Any Building

Cost per hour for emergency cleaning services at any location covered under this 

Agreement

Type of Floor / Maintenance

VCT – Stripping and Waxing/Buffing per Square foot

Tile Ceramic – Deep Cleaning

Polished Concrete – Deep Cleaning

Building Name

Air Traffic Control Tower

9:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m. 

9:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.

OPTIONAL  LINE ITEMS- Not included in Total Bid Amount

Airport Terminal- Per Occurance

24.50$                        

73.50$                        

Emergency Cleaning Services

Floor Maintenance

Air Traffic Contol Tower Window Cleaning

Exterior / Interior Elevated Window Cleaning

TOTAL PRICE PER WEEK:

Airport Terminal (excluding Airport Admin)

Air Traffic Control Tower

Hangar 19

Airport Administration

Small Terminal Suite 201A

T-Hangar Bathrooms (3)

1

2

3

4

5

6

BID TABULATION & NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD
Buyer: Brittany Craven

Buyer Phone: 352-629-8544

Email: bcraven@ocalafl.gov

WEEKLY PRICE

RFQ# AIR/240384 - Janitorial Services - Airport

ITEM DESCRIPTION SERVICE HOURS
CLEANING 

FREQUENCY
WEEKLY PRICE

02/27/2024  Notice of Intent to Award to Milclean USA pending City Council approval.

WEEKLY PRICE
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