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AGREEMENT FOR FUEL SUPPLY AND TRANSFER SERVICES 

THIS AGREEMENT FOR FUEL SUPPLY AND TRANSFER SERVICES (“Agreement”) is entered into by 
and between the CITY OF OCALA, a Florida municipal corporation (“City”), and PETROLEUM TRADERS 
CORPORATION a foreign for-profit corporation duly organized in the state of Indiana and authorized 
to do business in the state of Florida (EIN: 35-1462227) (“Contractor”). 

WHEREAS, on April 5, 2023, the City of Ocala, and the School Board of Marion County (the 
“School Board”) issued a joint Invitation to Bid (“ITB”), Bid No. 3980GM for the provision of providing 
gasoline and diesel fuel to both the City and the School Board (the “Solicitation”); and 

WHEREAS, five (5) firms responded to the Solicitation and, after the consideration of price and 
other evaluation factors set forth in the Solicitation, the bid submitted by Petroleum Traders Corporation 
was found to be the lowest; and 

WHEREAS, Petroleum Traders Corporation was chosen as the intended awardee to supply and 
deliver gasoline and diesel fuel to the City and School Board (“Services”). 

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals, the following mutual covenants 
and conditions, and other good and valuable consideration, City and Contractor agree as follows: 

1. RECITALS. City and Contractor hereby represent, warrant, and agree that the Recitals set forth above 
are true and correct and are incorporated herein by reference. 

2. CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. The Contract Documents which comprise the entire understanding 
between City and Contractor shall only include: (a) this Agreement; (b) those documents listed in 
this section as Exhibits to this Agreement; and (c) the City’s Solicitation for the Services and the bid 
submitted by Contractor in response to same (the “Solicitation Documents”).  Each of these 
documents are incorporated herein by reference for all purposes.  If there is a conflict between the 
terms of this Agreement and the Contract Documents, then the terms of this Agreement shall 
control, amend, and supersede any conflicting terms contained in the remaining Contract 
Documents. 
A. Exhibits to Agreement:  The Exhibits to this Agreement are as follows: 

Exhibit A:  Scope of Work (A-1 through A-8) 
Exhibit B:  Bid Tabulation (B-1 through B-2) 
Exhibit C:  General Conditions (C-1 through C-34) 

If there is a conflict between the individual Exhibits regarding the scope of work to be performed, 
then any identified inconsistency shall be resolved by giving precedence in the following order: (1) 
Exhibit C, then (2) Exhibit A, then (3) Exhibit C. 

3. AMENDED TERMS AND CONDITIONS. The following terms and conditions of the Solicitation 
Documents are modified and replaced, in their entirety, as follows: 

a. The terms “Marion County,” “County,” or “Board of County Commissioners” shall be replaced 
and intended to refer to the “City of Ocala”. 

b. The term “Bidder” shall be replaced by the term “Contractor” and shall be intended to refer 
to Petroleum Traders Corporation”.  

4. SCOPE OF SERVICES. Contractor shall provide all materials, labor, supervision, tools, accessories, 
equipment, permits, certifications, and all other things necessary for Contractor to perform its 
obligations under this Agreement as set forth in the attached Exhibit A - Scope of Work and the 
Solicitation Documents. In the event of a conflict between this Agreement and the Solicitation 
Documents as to the Scope of Services to be performed by Contractor, this Agreement and all of its 
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Exhibits shall be given precedence to resolve any identified inconsistency.  The Scope of Work may 
only be adjusted by written amendment executed by both parties. 

5. COMPENSATION. City shall pay Contractor a maximum limiting amount not to exceed TWO 
MILLION, FIVE HUNDRED THOUSAND AND NO/100 DOLLARS ($2,500,000) (the “Contract 
Sum”) as full and complete compensation for the timely and satisfactory completion of the work in 
compliance with the Contract Documents and prices set forth in Exhibit B – Bid Tabulation.  
A. Invoice Submission. Contractor shall invoice after the delivery of goods.  Invoices submitted by 

Contractor shall include the City Contract Number, an assigned Invoice Number, and an Invoice 
Date. Contractor shall be provided a coversheet for their invoices which must be filled out 
correctly and submitted with each invoice.  Contractor shall submit the original invoice through 
the responsible City Project Manager at:  City of Ocala Fleet Management Department, Attn: 
Ashley Rothchild, 1805 NE 30th Avenue, Ocala, Florida 34470, E-mail: 
arothchild@ocalafl.org.  

B. Payment of Invoices by City. The City Project Manager must review and approve all invoices 
prior to payment. City Project Manager’s approval shall not be unreasonably withheld, 
conditioned, or delayed.  

C. Withholding of Payment. City reserves the right to withhold, in whole or in part, payment for 
any and all work that: (i) has not been completed by Contractor; (ii) is inadequate or defective 
and has not been remedied or resolved in a manner satisfactory to the City Project Manager; or 
(iii) which fails to comply with any term, condition, or other requirement under this Agreement.  
Any payment withheld shall be released and remitted to Contractor within THIRTY (30) calendar 
days of the Contractor’s remedy or resolution of the inadequacy or defect. 

D. Excess Funds. If due to mistake or any other reason Contractor receives payment under this 
Agreement in excess of what is provided for by the Agreement, Contractor shall promptly notify 
City upon discovery of the receipt of the overpayment.  Any overpayment shall be refunded to 
City within THIRTY (30) days of Contractor’s receipt of the overpayment or must also include 
interest calculated from the date of the overpayment at the interest rate for judgments at the 
highest rate as allowed by law. 

E. Amounts Due to the City.  Contractor must be current and remain current in all obligations 
due to the City during the performance of services under the Agreement.  Payments to 
Contractor may be offset by any delinquent amounts due to the City or fees and/or charges 
owed to the City.   

F. Tax Exemption.  City is exempt from all federal excise and state sales taxes (State of Florida 
Consumer’s Certification of Exemption 85-8012621655C-9). The City’s Employer Identification 
Number is 59-60000392. Contractor shall not be exempted from paying sales tax to its suppliers 
for materials to fulfill contractual obligations with the City, nor will Contractor be authorized to 
use City’s Tax Exemption Number for securing materials listed herein. 

6. EFFECTIVE DATE AND TERM. This Agreement shall become effective and commence on MAY 30, 
2023 and continue for a term of THIRTEEN MONTHS (13 months), through and including JUNE 
30, 2024.  

7. PUBLIC RECORDS. Contractor shall comply with all applicable provisions of the Florida Public 
Records Act, Chapter 119, Florida Statutes. Specifically, Contractor shall:  
A. Keep and maintain public records required by the public agency to perform the service. 
B. Upon request from the public agency’s custodian of public records, provide the public agency 

with a copy of the requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied within a 
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reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost provided in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, 
or as otherwise provided by law. 

C. Ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public records 
disclosure requirements are not disclosed except as authorized by law for the duration of the 
contract term and following completion of the contract if Contractor does not transfer the 
records to the public agency. 

D. Upon completion of the contract, transfer, at no cost, to the public agency all public records in 
possession of Contractor or keep and maintain public records required by the public agency to 
perform the service. If Contractor transfers all public records to the public agency upon 
completion of the contract, Contractor shall destroy any duplicate public records that are exempt 
or confidential and exempt from public records disclosure requirements. If Contractor keeps and 
maintains public records upon completion of the contract, Contractor shall meet all applicable 
requirements for retaining public records. All records stored electronically must be provided to 
the public agency, upon request from the public agency’s custodian of public records, in a format 
that is compatible with the information technology systems of the public agency. 

IF CONTRACTOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE APPLICATION OF 
CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO CONTRACTOR’S DUTY TO 
PROVIDE PUBLIC RECORDS RELATING TO THIS CONTRACT, CONTACT 
THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS AT: CITY OF OCALA, OFFICE OF THE 
CITY CLERK; 352-629-8266; E-mail: clerk@ocalafl.org; City Hall, 110 SE 
Watula Avenue, Ocala, FL 34471. 

8. AUDIT. Contractor shall comply and cooperate immediately with any inspections, reviews, 
investigations, or audits relating to this Agreement as deemed necessary by the Florida Office of the 
Inspector General, the City’s Internal or External auditors or by any other Florida official with proper 
authority. 

9. PUBLICITY. Contractor shall not use City’s name, logo, seal or other likeness in any press release, 
marketing materials, or other public announcement without City’s prior written approval. 

10. E-VERIFY.  Pursuant to section 448.095, Contractor shall register with and use the U.S. Department 
of Homeland Security’s (“DHS”) E-Verify System, accessible at https://e-verify.uscis.gov/emp, to 
verify the work authorization status of all newly hired employees.  Contractor shall obtain affidavits 
from any and all subcontractors in accordance with paragraph 2(b) of section 448.095, Florida 
Statutes, and maintain copies of such affidavits for the duration of this Agreement.  By entering into 
this Agreement, Contractor certifies and ensures that it utilizes and will continue to utilize the DHS 
E-Verify System for the duration of this Agreement and any subsequent renewals of same.  
Contractor understands that failure to comply with the requirements of this section shall result in 
the termination of this Agreement and Contractor may lose the ability to be awarded a public 
contract for a minimum of one (1) year after the date on which the Agreement was terminated.  
Contractor shall provide a copy of its DHS Memorandum of Understanding upon City’s request.  
Please visit www.e-verify.gov for more information regarding the E-Verify System. 

11. CONFLICT OF INTEREST. Contractor must have disclosed with the submission of their bid, the name 
of any officer, director, or agent who may be employed by City. Contractor must disclose the name 
of any City employee who owns, directly or indirectly, any interest in Contractor or any affiliated 
business entity. Any additional conflicts of interest that may occur during the contract term must be 
disclosed to the City of Ocala Procurement Department.  
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12. WAIVER. The failure or delay of any party at any time to require performance by another party of
any provision of this Agreement, even if known, shall not affect the right of such party to require
performance of that provision or to exercise any right, power or remedy hereunder. Any waiver by
any party of any breach of any provision of this Agreement should not be construed as a waiver of
any continuing or succeeding breach of such provision, a waiver of the provision itself, or a waiver
of any right, power or remedy under this Agreement. No notice to or demand on any party in any
circumstance shall, of itself, entitle such party to any other or further notice or demand in similar or
other circumstances.

13. SEVERABILITY OF ILLEGAL PROVISIONS. Wherever possible, each provision of this Agreement
shall be interpreted in such a manner as to be effective and valid under the applicable law. Should
any portion of this Agreement be declared invalid for any reason, such declaration shall have no
effect upon the remaining portions of this Agreement.

14. INDEMNITY. Contractor shall indemnify City and its elected officials, employees and volunteers
against, and hold City and its elected officials, employees and volunteers harmless from, all damages,
claims, losses, costs, and expenses, including reasonable attorneys’ fees, which City or its elected
officials, employees or volunteers may sustain, or which may be asserted against City or its elected
officials, employees or volunteers, arising out of the activities contemplated by this Agreement
including, without limitation, harm or personal injury to third persons during the term of this
Agreement to the extent attributable to the actions of Contractor, its agents, and employees.

15. NO WAIVER OF SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY. Nothing herein is intended to waive sovereign immunity
by the City to which sovereign immunity may be applicable, or of any rights or limits of liability
existing under Florida Statute § 768.28. This term shall survive the termination of all performance or
obligations under this Agreement and shall be fully binding until any proceeding brought under this
Agreement is barred by any applicable statute of limitations.

16. NOTICES. All notices, certifications or communications required by this Agreement shall be given in
writing and shall be deemed delivered when personally served, or when received if by facsimile
transmission with a confirming copy mailed by registered or certified mail, postage prepaid, return
receipt requested. Notices can be concurrently delivered by e-mail. All notices shall be addressed to
the respective parties as follows:

If to Contractor: 

If to City of Ocala: 

Petroleum Traders Corporation 
Attention:  Joseph Vanderpool
PO Box 2357
Ft. Wayne, Indiana 46801 
Phone: 800-348-3705 
E-mail: jvanderpool@petroleumtraders.com

Daphne M. Robinson, Esq., Contracting Officer 
City of Ocala 
110 SE Watula Avenue, Third Floor 
Ocala, Florida 34471 
Phone: 352-629-8343  
E-mail: notices@ocalafl.org
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Copy to:   William E. Sexton, Esq., City Attorney 
City of Ocala 

                110 SE Watula Avenue, Third Floor 
          Ocala, Florida 34471 
          Phone: 352-401-3972 
          E-mail: cityattorney@ocalafl.org 

17. ATTORNEYS' FEES. If any civil action, arbitration or other legal proceeding is brought for the 
enforcement of this Agreement, or because of an alleged dispute, breach, default or 
misrepresentation in connection with any provision of this Agreement, the successful or prevailing 
party shall be entitled to recover reasonable attorneys' fees, sales and use taxes, court costs and all 
expenses reasonably incurred even if not taxable as court costs (including, without limitation, all 
such fees, taxes, costs and expenses incident to arbitration, appellate, bankruptcy and 
post-judgment proceedings), incurred in that civil action, arbitration or legal proceeding, in addition 
to any other relief to which such party or parties may be entitled. Attorneys' fees shall include, 
without limitation, paralegal fees, investigative fees, administrative costs, sales and use taxes and all 
other charges reasonably billed by the attorney to the prevailing party.  

18. JURY WAIVER. IN ANY CIVIL ACTION, COUNTERCLAIM, OR PROCEEDING, WHETHER 
AT LAW OR IN EQUITY, WHICH ARISES OUT OF, CONCERNS, OR RELATES TO THIS 
AGREEMENT, ANY AND ALL TRANSACTIONS CONTEMPLATED HEREUNDER, THE 
PERFORMANCE HEREOF, OR THE RELATIONSHIP CREATED HEREBY, WHETHER 
SOUNDING IN CONTRACT, TORT, STRICT LIABILITY, OR OTHERWISE, TRIAL SHALL 
BE TO A COURT OF COMPETENT JURISDICTION AND NOT TO A JURY. EACH PARTY 
HEREBY IRREVOCABLY WAIVES ANY RIGHT IT MAY HAVE TO A TRIAL BY JURY. 
NEITHER PARTY HAS MADE OR RELIED UPON ANY ORAL REPRESENTATIONS TO OR 
BY ANY OTHER PARTY REGARDING THE ENFORCEABILITY OF THIS PROVISION. 
EACH PARTY HAS READ AND UNDERSTANDS THE EFFECT OF THIS JURY WAIVER 
PROVISION. 

19. GOVERNING LAW. This Agreement is and shall be deemed to be a contract entered and made 
pursuant to the laws of the State of Florida and shall in all respects be governed, construed, applied 
and enforced in accordance with the laws of the State of Florida. 

20. JURISDICTION AND VENUE. The parties acknowledge that a majority of the negotiations, 
anticipated performance and execution of this Agreement occurred or shall occur in Marion County, 
Florida. Any civil action or legal proceeding arising out of or relating to this Agreement shall be 
brought only in the courts of record of the State of Florida in Marion County or the United States 
District Court, Middle District of Florida, Ocala Division. Each party consents to the exclusive 
jurisdiction of such court in any such civil action or legal proceeding and waives any objection to 
the laying of venue of any such civil action or legal proceeding in such court and/or the right to 
bring an action or proceeding in any other court. Service of any court paper may be effected on 
such party by mail, as provided in this Agreement, or in such other manner as may be provided 
under applicable laws, rules of procedures or local rules.  
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21. REFERENCE TO PARTIES. Each reference herein to the parties shall be deemed to include their 
successors, assigns, heirs, administrators, and legal representatives, all whom shall be bound by the 
provisions hereof. 

22. MUTUALITY OF NEGOTIATION. Contractor and City acknowledge that this Agreement is a result 
of negotiations between Contractor and City, and the Agreement shall not be construed in favor of, 
or against, either party because of that party having been more involved in the drafting of the 
Agreement. 

23. SECTION HEADINGS. The section headings herein are included for convenience only and shall not 
be deemed to be a part of this Agreement.  

24. RIGHTS OF THIRD PARTIES. Nothing in this Agreement, whether express or implied, is intended 
to confer any rights or remedies under or because of this Agreement on any persons other than the 
parties hereto and their respective legal representatives, successors and permitted assigns. Nothing 
in this Agreement is intended to relieve or discharge the obligation or liability of any third persons 
to any party to this Agreement, nor shall any provision give any third persons any right of 
subrogation or action over or against any party to this Agreement. 

25. AMENDMENT. No amendment to this Agreement shall be effective except those agreed to in 
writing and signed by both parties to this Agreement. 

26. COUNTERPARTS. This Agreement may be executed in counterparts, each of which shall be an 
original and all of which shall constitute the same instrument. 

27. ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE(S). Contractor, if and by offering an electronic signature in any form 
whatsoever, will accept and agree to be bound by said electronic signature to all terms and 
conditions of this Agreement. Further, a duplicate or copy of the Agreement that contains a 
duplicated or non-original signature will be treated the same as an original, signed copy of this 
original Agreement for all purposes.  

28. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This Agreement, including exhibits, (if any) constitutes the entire Agreement 
between the parties hereto with respect to the subject matter hereof. There are no other 
representations, warranties, promises, agreements or understandings, oral, written or implied, 
among the Parties, except to the extent reference is made thereto in this Agreement. No course of 
prior dealings between the parties and no usage of trade shall be relevant or admissible to 
supplement, explain, or vary any of the terms of this Agreement. No representations, 
understandings, or agreements have been made or relied upon in the making of this Agreement 
other than those specifically set forth herein. 

29. LEGAL AUTHORITY. Each person signing this Agreement on behalf of either party individually 
warrants that he or she has full legal power to execute this Agreement on behalf of the party for 
whom he or she is signing, and to bind and obligate such party with respect to all provisions 
contained in this Agreement. 

 

 

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK. SIGNATURE PAGE TO FOLLOW] 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Agreement on ___________________________. 
 
 
ATTEST: 

 
 
CITY OF OCALA 

 
 

______________________________________ 
Angel B. Jacobs 
City Clerk 

 

 
________________________________________ 
James P. Hilty, Sr. 
City Council President 
 
 
 

Approved as to form and legality: 
 
 
______________________________________ 
William E. Sexton, Esq. 
City Attorney 

PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION 
 
 
_____________________________________________ 
 
 
By: __________________________________________ 
                                       (Printed Name) 

 
 
Title:________________________________________ 
                      (Title of Authorized Signatory) 
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Exhibit A - Scope of Work
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SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"

Bid Tabulation Posted:  4/21/23
BID #3980GM
Bid Title: Gasoline, Diesel, and Biodiesel, Joint Entity Term Contract ~ Term: May 30, 2023 to June 30, 2024
Date & Time Due: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
Board Date:  May 9, 2023
Budgeted Department:  Transportation and Technical Services
Estimated Budgeted Resources $ 4,500,000

Secondary 
Awardee for Red 

Dye Diesel

Vendors
Clardy Oil 
Company, 
Ocala, FL

Vendor ID CLARDY_O001

Drug Free Workplace Y

Certificate of Liability N

Common Carrier Waiver N

Certification Regarding Debarment Y

Preference Document / % Florida

Redacted Copy Provided N

Qualification Statement Y

W-9 Y

Type of Fuel

# Description Unit Price Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

1 Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane NO BID 0.157000 0.1648500 -$0.0033 -$0.00314 -$0.0682 -$0.06752

2 Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane, E-10 $0.049000 -0.028000 -0.0266000 -0.0350 -0.0332500 -$0.0374 -$0.03553 -$0.0582 -$0.05762

3 Diesel Fuel, Grade 2D, Ultra Low Sulfur $0.049000 -0.043000 -0.0408500 -0.0300 -0.0285000 -$0.0098 -$0.00931 -$0.0452 -$0.04475

4 Biodiesel Blend Fuel, B5 NO BID -$0.0098 -$0.00931

5
Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane, E-10, Delivered to 
Liberty Middle School   (500 gal tank)

6
Ultra Low Sulfer Diesel Fuel, Red Dye, Grade 
No. 2-D, Delivered to Diesel Generator Sites $0.990000 $0.862000 $0.90510

Allowable Fees

# Description Unit Price Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

Unit Price
Preference 
Adjustment

7 Freight Charges: Gasoline, per gallon $0.06312 $0.1111 $0.116655 $0.0760 $0.079800 $0.0846 $0.08883 $0.0772 $0.077972

8 Freight Charges: Diesel, per gallon $0.07138 $0.1149 $0.120645 $0.0858 $0.090090 $0.0893 $0.09377 $0.0893 $0.090193

9 Freight Charges: Bio-Diesel, per gallon NO BID $0.0893 $0.09377

10
Bank Card Charge/ P-Card Charge, % 
upcharge

NO BID

11 Same Day Delivery Charge, per delivery $100.00

12 Pump Off Charge, per delivery $50.00

13 Multiple Stop Delivery, per stop $50.00

14
Demurrage/ Excessive Delay Charge, per 
delivery

$80.00

15 Back Haul Charge, per daily deliveries $250.00

16
Less than Transport Load Charge, per 
gallon

$0.075

$50.00

$75/Per hour

$200.00

$0.0893

$60.00

$50.00

$100/ per hour

$450.00

$0.0800

3.5%

$95/Hr

$350.00

$0.1111

$75.00

$65.00

$65.00

$100/Hr

$250.00

$0.0810

$70.00

$100.00

$50.00

3% 4%

$50.00

Y

NO BID

NO BID NO BIDNO BID

$350.00 $100.00

Y

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

ALL BIDS REJECTED

Y

Georgia / Reciprocal
5%

N

Y

Indiana / 1%

N

Y

Mansfield Oil Company of 
Gainesville, Inc., 
Gainesville, GA

MANSFIEL000 PETROLEU002

Colonial Oil Industries, Inc, 
Savannah, GA

NEW

N

YY

Primary Awardee for Gas and 
Diesel

NO BID

Awarded Biodiesel

Y

Y

Petroleum Traders 
Corporation, Fort Wayne, 

IN

NO BID

Y

Secondary Awardee for Gas and
Diesel

YY

Y

Georgia / No Preference
(Automatic 5%)

Y

Y

Indigo Energy Partners, 
LLC, Gainesville, GA

INDIGO_E000

Y

Y

Y

N

Primary Awardee for Red Dye Diesel

Y

Y

NO BID

Y

Georgia / No Preference
5%

Y

Y

Y
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Exhibit B - Bid Tabulation

DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D



SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"

Bid Tabulation Posted:  4/21/23
BID #3980GM
Bid Title: Gasoline, Diesel, and Biodiesel, Joint Entity Term Contract ~ Term: May 30, 2023 to June 30, 2024
Date & Time Due: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 @ 2:00 PM
Board Date:  May 9, 2023
Budgeted Department:  Transportation and Technical Services
Estimated Budgeted Resources $ 4,500,000

Secondary 
Awardee for Red 

Dye Diesel

Vendors
Clardy Oil 
Company, 
Ocala, FL

Mansfield Oil Company of 
Gainesville, Inc., 
Gainesville, GA

Colonial Oil Industries, Inc, 
Savannah, GA

Primary Awardee for Gas and 
Diesel

Awarded Biodiesel

Petroleum Traders 
Corporation, Fort Wayne, 

IN

Secondary Awardee for Gas and
Diesel

Indigo Energy Partners, 
LLC, Gainesville, GA

Primary Awardee for Red Dye Diesel

Gasoline Markup Plus Freight $0.268100 $0.281505 $0.081300 $0.085695 $0.009000 $0.010454

Gasoline (E-10) Markup Plus Freight $0.112120 $0.083100 $0.090055 $0.041000 $0.046550 $0.047200 $0.053300 $0.019000 $0.020354

Diesel Markup Plus Freight $0.120380 $0.071900 $0.079795 $0.055800 $0.061590 $0.079500 $0.084455 $0.044100 $0.045445

Biodiesel Markup Plus Freight NO BID $0.079500 $0.084455

Red Dye Diesel Markup Plus Freight $1.0614 $0.9769 $1.0257

gasoline - 98,400g $11,032.61 $8,177.04 $8,861.41 $4,034.40 $4,580.52 $4,644.48 $5,244.72 $1,869.60 $2,002.83

diesel - 660,000g $79,450.80 $47,454.00 $52,664.70 $36,828.00 $40,649.40 $52,470.00 $55,740.30 $29,106.00 $29,993.70

TOTAL $90,483.41 $55,631.04 $61,526.11 $40,862.40 $45,229.92 $57,114.48 $60,985.02 $30,975.60 $31,996.53

Gasoline - 330,579.10g $37,064.53 $27,471.12 $29,770.30 $13,553.74 $15,388.46 $15,603.33 $17,619.87 $6,281.00 $6,728.61

Diesel - 500,118.8g $60,204.30 $35,958.54 $39,906.98 $27,906.63 $30,802.32 $39,759.44 $42,237.53 $22,055.24 $22,727.90

TOTAL $97,268.83 $63,429.66 $69,677.28 $41,460.37 $46,190.77 $55,362.78 $59,857.40 $28,336.24 $29,456.51

Grand Total for Bulk Fuel to Both City of 
Ocala and The School Board of Marion 

County, Florida 
$187,752.24 $119,060.70 $131,203.39 $82,322.77 $91,420.69 $112,477.26 $120,842.42 $59,311.84 $61,453.04

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Red Dye Diesel

Calculation for Estimated Quantities in Bid for MCPS

Calculation for Estimated Quantities in Bid for City of Ocala

Bulk Fuel

NO BID

Gasoline Diesel Biodiesel 3980GM TABULATION.xls 2
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DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D
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Exhibit C

DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D
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FLT/230544

C-2

DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D
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DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D
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DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D
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DocuSign Envelope ID: 85342B89-DEAC-4BC3-8D9D-C143A9ABCB1D
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Certificate Of Completion
Envelope Id: 85342B89DEAC4BC38D9DC143A9ABCB1D Status: Completed

Subject: Fuel Supply and Transport Services - Petroleum Traders Corporation (FLT/230544)

Source Envelope: 

Document Pages: 51 Signatures: 2 Envelope Originator: 

Certificate Pages: 5 Initials: 0 Brittany Craven

AutoNav: Enabled

EnvelopeId Stamping: Enabled

Time Zone: (UTC-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada)

110 SE Watula Avenue

City Hall, Third Floor

Ocala, FL  34471

biverson@ocalafl.org

IP Address: 216.255.240.104

Record Tracking
Status: Original

             5/31/2023 10:03:17 AM

Holder: Brittany Craven

             biverson@ocalafl.org

Location: DocuSign

Security Appliance Status: Connected Pool: StateLocal

Storage Appliance Status: Connected Pool: City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting Location: DocuSign

Signer Events Signature Timestamp
Joseph Vanderpool

jvanderpool@petroleumtraders.com

Contract Sales Manager

Security Level: Email, Account Authentication 
(None) Signature Adoption: Pre-selected Style

Using IP Address: 184.17.61.146

Sent: 5/31/2023 10:08:39 AM

Resent: 5/31/2023 11:36:37 AM

Viewed: 5/31/2023 11:44:39 AM 

Signed: 5/31/2023 11:51:29 AM

Electronic Record and Signature Disclosure: 
      Accepted: 5/31/2023 11:44:39 AM
      ID: e310d797-fa2d-47c6-9096-44b03ab8473d

William E. Sexton

wsexton@ocalafl.org

City Attorney

City of Ocala

Security Level: Email, Account Authentication 
(None)

Signature Adoption: Pre-selected Style

Using IP Address: 216.255.240.104

Sent: 5/31/2023 10:12:59 AM

Viewed: 5/31/2023 10:51:49 AM 

Signed: 5/31/2023 3:50:23 PM

Electronic Record and Signature Disclosure: 
      Not Offered via DocuSign

In Person Signer Events Signature Timestamp

Editor Delivery Events Status Timestamp

Agent Delivery Events Status Timestamp

Intermediary Delivery Events Status Timestamp

Certified Delivery Events Status Timestamp

Carbon Copy Events Status Timestamp

Witness Events Signature Timestamp

Notary Events Signature Timestamp

Envelope Summary Events Status Timestamps



Envelope Summary Events Status Timestamps
Envelope Sent Hashed/Encrypted 5/31/2023 10:08:39 AM

Envelope Updated Security Checked 5/31/2023 10:12:59 AM

Envelope Updated Security Checked 5/31/2023 11:36:36 AM

Envelope Updated Security Checked 5/31/2023 11:36:36 AM

Envelope Updated Security Checked 5/31/2023 11:36:36 AM

Envelope Updated Security Checked 5/31/2023 11:36:36 AM

Envelope Updated Security Checked 5/31/2023 11:36:37 AM

Certified Delivered Security Checked 5/31/2023 10:51:49 AM

Signing Complete Security Checked 5/31/2023 3:50:23 PM

Completed Security Checked 5/31/2023 3:50:23 PM

Payment Events Status Timestamps

Electronic Record and Signature Disclosure



ELECTRONIC RECORD AND SIGNATURE DISCLOSURE  

From time to time, City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting (we, us or Company) may be 

required by law to provide to you certain written notices or disclosures. Described below are the 

terms and conditions for providing to you such notices and disclosures electronically through the 

DocuSign system. Please read the information below carefully and thoroughly, and if you can 

access this information electronically to your satisfaction and agree to this Electronic Record and 

Signature Disclosure (ERSD), please confirm your agreement by selecting the check-box next to 

‘I agree to use electronic records and signatures’ before clicking ‘CONTINUE’ within the 

DocuSign system. 

 

Getting paper copies  

At any time, you may request from us a paper copy of any record provided or made available 

electronically to you by us. You will have the ability to download and print documents we send 

to you through the DocuSign system during and immediately after the signing session and, if you 

elect to create a DocuSign account, you may access the documents for a limited period of time 

(usually 30 days) after such documents are first sent to you. After such time, if you wish for us to 

send you paper copies of any such documents from our office to you, you will be charged a 

$0.00 per-page fee. You may request delivery of such paper copies from us by following the 

procedure described below. 

 

Withdrawing your consent  

If you decide to receive notices and disclosures from us electronically, you may at any time 

change your mind and tell us that thereafter you want to receive required notices and disclosures 

only in paper format. How you must inform us of your decision to receive future notices and 

disclosure in paper format and withdraw your consent to receive notices and disclosures 

electronically is described below. 

 

Consequences of changing your mind  

If you elect to receive required notices and disclosures only in paper format, it will slow the 

speed at which we can complete certain steps in transactions with you and delivering services to 

you because we will need first to send the required notices or disclosures to you in paper format, 

and then wait until we receive back from you your acknowledgment of your receipt of such 

paper notices or disclosures. Further, you will no longer be able to use the DocuSign system to 

receive required notices and consents electronically from us or to sign electronically documents 

from us. 

 

All notices and disclosures will be sent to you electronically  
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Unless you tell us otherwise in accordance with the procedures described herein, we will provide 

electronically to you through the DocuSign system all required notices, disclosures, 

authorizations, acknowledgements, and other documents that are required to be provided or made 

available to you during the course of our relationship with you. To reduce the chance of you 

inadvertently not receiving any notice or disclosure, we prefer to provide all of the required 

notices and disclosures to you by the same method and to the same address that you have given 

us. Thus, you can receive all the disclosures and notices electronically or in paper format through 

the paper mail delivery system. If you do not agree with this process, please let us know as 

described below. Please also see the paragraph immediately above that describes the 

consequences of your electing not to receive delivery of the notices and disclosures 

electronically from us. 

 

How to contact City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting:  

You may contact us to let us know of your changes as to how we may contact you electronically, 

to request paper copies of certain information from us, and to withdraw your prior consent to 

receive notices and disclosures electronically as follows: 

To contact us by email send messages to: contracts@ocalafl.org 

 

To advise City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting of your new email address  

To let us know of a change in your email address where we should send notices and disclosures 

electronically to you, you must send an email message to us at contracts@ocalafl.org and in the 

body of such request you must state: your previous email address, your new email address.  We 

do not require any other information from you to change your email address.  

If you created a DocuSign account, you may update it with your new email address through your 

account preferences.  

 

To request paper copies from City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting  

To request delivery from us of paper copies of the notices and disclosures previously provided 

by us to you electronically, you must send us an email to contracts@ocalafl.org and in the body 

of such request you must state your email address, full name, mailing address, and telephone 

number. We will bill you for any fees at that time, if any. 

 

To withdraw your consent with City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting  

To inform us that you no longer wish to receive future notices and disclosures in electronic 

format you may: 



i. decline to sign a document from within your signing session, and on the subsequent page, 

select the check-box indicating you wish to withdraw your consent, or you may; 

ii. send us an email to contracts@ocalafl.org and in the body of such request you must state your 

email, full name, mailing address, and telephone number. We do not need any other information 

from you to withdraw consent..  The consequences of your withdrawing consent for online 

documents will be that transactions may take a longer time to process.. 

 

Required hardware and software  

The minimum system requirements for using the DocuSign system may change over time. The 

current system requirements are found here: https://support.docusign.com/guides/signer-guide-

signing-system-requirements.  

 

Acknowledging your access and consent to receive and sign documents electronically  

To confirm to us that you can access this information electronically, which will be similar to 

other electronic notices and disclosures that we will provide to you, please confirm that you have 

read this ERSD, and (i) that you are able to print on paper or electronically save this ERSD for 

your future reference and access; or (ii) that you are able to email this ERSD to an email address 

where you will be able to print on paper or save it for your future reference and access. Further, 

if you consent to receiving notices and disclosures exclusively in electronic format as described 

herein, then select the check-box next to ‘I agree to use electronic records and signatures’ before 

clicking ‘CONTINUE’ within the DocuSign system. 

By selecting the check-box next to ‘I agree to use electronic records and signatures’, you confirm 

that: 

 You can access and read this Electronic Record and Signature Disclosure; and 

 You can print on paper this Electronic Record and Signature Disclosure, or save or send 

this Electronic Record and Disclosure to a location where you can print it, for future 

reference and access; and 

 Until or unless you notify City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting as described above, 

you consent to receive exclusively through electronic means all notices, disclosures, 

authorizations, acknowledgements, and other documents that are required to be provided 

or made available to you by City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting during the course 

of your relationship with City of Ocala - Procurement & Contracting. 
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