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TABLEE 1:: CATEGORYY 11 -- CEMENTITIOUSS LININGS  

Vendor Total

Atlantic Pipe Services, LLC $3,823,012.00

Engineered Coatings 
Solutions LLC

No Bid

Vortex Services LLC $1,873,745.00

Insituform Technologies, 
LLC

$2,049,200.00

National Water Main 
Cleaning Company

$2,808,950.00

Hinterland Group Inc $2,901,100.00

Hydro-Klean,LLC $2,925,345.00

Engineered Spray 
Solutions

$3,199,400.00

PAINTS & COATNIGS, INC. $4,113,500.00
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TABLE 2: CATEGORY 2 - POLYURETHANE LININGS   

Vendor Total 
Atlantic Pipe Services, LLC No Bid 

Engineered Coatings 
Solutions LLC 

No Bid 

Engineered Spray 
Solutions 

$5,533,500.00 

Hinterland Group Inc No Bid 

Hydro-Klean,LLC No Bid 

Insituform Technologies, 
LLC 

$0.00 

National Water Main 
Cleaning Company 

No Bid 

PAINTS & COATNIGS, INC. No Bid 

Vortex Services LLC No Bid 
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TTABLEE 3:: CATEGORYY 33 -- EPOXYY LININGS  

Vendor Total

Engineered Coatings 
Solutions LLC

$2,392,275.00

Insituform Technologies, 
LLC

$4,302,760.00

Engineered Spray 
Solutions

$4,449,400.00

PAINTS & COATNIGS, INC. $5,631,050.00

National Water Main 
Cleaning Company

$6,640,450.00

Atlantic Pipe Services, LLC $7,426,849.00

Hinterland Group Inc No Bid

Hydro-Klean,LLC No Bid

Vortex Services LLC $6,893,745.00
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TTABLEE 4:: CATEGORYY 44 -- GEOPOLYMERR LININGS  

Vendor Total

Atlantic Pipe Services, LLC No Bid

Engineered Coatings 
Solutions LLC

No Bid

Vortex Services LLC $1,888,745.00

Insituform Technologies, 
LLC

$2,286,700.00

National Water Main 
Cleaning Company

$2,920,950.00

Engineered Spray 
Solutions

$3,240,200.00

Hinterland Group Inc No Bid

Hydro-Klean,LLC $2,956,850.00

PAINTS & COATNIGS, INC. No Bid


