

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"										
Bid Tabulation Posted: 4/21/23										
BID #3980GM										
Bid Title: Gasoline, Diesel, and Biodiesel, Joint Entity Term Contract ~ Term: May 30, 2023 to June 30, 2024										
Date & Time Due: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 @ 2:00 PM										
Board Date: May 9, 2023										
Budgeted Department: Transportation and Technical Services										
Estimated Budgeted Resources \$ 4,500,000										
		Secondary Awardee for Red Dye Diesel	Primary Awardee for Red Dye Diesel	Secondary Awardee for Gas and Diesel		Awarded Biodiesel		Primary Awardee for Gas and Diesel		
	Vendors	Clardy Oil Company, Ocala, FL	Colonial Oil Industries, Inc, Savannah, GA	Indigo Energy Partners, LLC, Gainesville, GA		Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc., Gainesville, GA		Petroleum Traders Corporation, Fort Wayne, IN		
	Vendor ID	CLARDY_O001	NEW	INDIGO_E000		MANSFIEL000		PETROLEU002		
	Drug Free Workplace	Y	Y	Y		Y		Y		
	Certificate of Liability	N	Y	Y		Y		N		
	Common Carrier Waiver	N	Y	Y		Y		Y		
	Certification Regarding Debarment	Y	Y	Y		Y		Y		
	Preference Document / %	Florida	Georgia / Reciprocal 5%	Georgia / No Preference 5%		Georgia / No Preference (Automatic 5%)		Indiana / 1%		
	Redacted Copy Provided	N	N	Y		N		N		
	Qualification Statement	Y	Y	Y		Y		Y		
	W-9	Y	Y	Y		Y		Y		
Type of Fuel										
#	Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment
1	Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane	NO BID	0.157000	0.1648500	NO BID		-\$0.0033	-\$0.00314	-\$0.0682	-\$0.06752
2	Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane, E-10	\$0.049000	-0.028000	-0.0266000	-0.0350	-0.0332500	-\$0.0374	-\$0.03553	-\$0.0582	-\$0.05762
3	Diesel Fuel, Grade 2D, Ultra Low Sulfur	\$0.049000	-0.043000	-0.0408500	-0.0300	-0.0285000	-\$0.0098	-\$0.00931	-\$0.0452	-\$0.04475
4	Biodiesel Blend Fuel, B5	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID		-\$0.0098	-\$0.00931	NO BID	
5	Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane, E-10, Delivered to Liberty Middle School (500 gal tank)	ALL BIDS REJECTED								
6	Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel, Red Dye, Grade No. 2-D, Delivered to Diesel Generator Sites	\$0.990000	\$0.862000	\$0.90510	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Allowable Fees										
#	Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment	Unit Price	Preference Adjustment
7	Freight Charges: Gasoline, per gallon	\$0.06312	\$0.1111	\$0.116655	\$0.0760	\$0.079800	\$0.0846	\$0.08883	\$0.0772	\$0.077972
8	Freight Charges: Diesel, per gallon	\$0.07138	\$0.1149	\$0.120645	\$0.0858	\$0.090090	\$0.0893	\$0.09377	\$0.0893	\$0.090193
9	Freight Charges: Bio-Diesel, per gallon	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID		\$0.0893	\$0.09377	NO BID	
10	Bank Card Charge/ P-Card Charge, % upcharge	NO BID	3%		4%		3.5%		NO BID	
11	Same Day Delivery Charge, per delivery	\$100.00	\$350.00		\$75.00		\$100.00		\$100.00	
12	Pump Off Charge, per delivery	\$50.00	\$70.00		\$65.00		\$50.00		\$60.00	
13	Multiple Stop Delivery, per stop	\$50.00	\$50.00		\$65.00		\$50.00		\$50.00	
14	Demurrage/ Excessive Delay Charge, per delivery	\$80.00	\$95/Hr		\$100/Hr		\$75/Per hour		\$100/ per hour	
15	Back Haul Charge, per daily deliveries	\$250.00	\$350.00		\$250.00		\$200.00		\$450.00	
16	Less than Transport Load Charge, per gallon	\$0.075	\$0.1111		\$0.0810		\$0.0893		\$0.0800	

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"										
Bid Tabulation Posted: 4/21/23										
BID #3980GM										
Bid Title: Gasoline, Diesel, and Biodiesel, Joint Entity Term Contract ~ Term: May 30, 2023 to June 30, 2024										
Date & Time Due: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 @ 2:00 PM										
Board Date: May 9, 2023										
Budgeted Department: Transportation and Technical Services										
Estimated Budgeted Resources \$ 4,500,000										
		Secondary Awardee for Red Dye Diesel	Primary Awardee for Red Dye Diesel	Secondary Awardee for Gas and Diesel		Awarded Biodiesel		Primary Awardee for Gas and Diesel		
	Vendors	Clardy Oil Company, Ocala, FL	Colonial Oil Industries, Inc., Savannah, GA	Indigo Energy Partners, LLC, Gainesville, GA		Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc., Gainesville, GA		Petroleum Traders Corporation, Fort Wayne, IN		
Bulk Fuel										
	Gasoline Markup Plus Freight		\$0.268100	\$0.281505			\$0.081300	\$0.085695	\$0.009000	\$0.010454
	Gasoline (E-10) Markup Plus Freight	\$0.112120	\$0.083100	\$0.090055	\$0.041000	\$0.046550	\$0.047200	\$0.053300	\$0.019000	\$0.020354
	Diesel Markup Plus Freight	\$0.120380	\$0.071900	\$0.079795	\$0.055800	\$0.061590	\$0.079500	\$0.084455	\$0.044100	\$0.045445
	Biodiesel Markup Plus Freight	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID		\$0.079500	\$0.084455	NO BID	
Red Dye Diesel										
	Red Dye Diesel Markup Plus Freight	\$1.0614	\$0.9769	\$1.0257	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
Calculation for Estimated Quantities in Bid for MCPS										
	gasoline - 98,400g	\$11,032.61	\$8,177.04	\$8,861.41	\$4,034.40	\$4,580.52	\$4,644.48	\$5,244.72	\$1,869.60	\$2,002.83
	diesel - 660,000g	\$79,450.80	\$47,454.00	\$52,664.70	\$36,828.00	\$40,649.40	\$52,470.00	\$55,740.30	\$29,106.00	\$29,993.70
	TOTAL	\$90,483.41	\$55,631.04	\$61,526.11	\$40,862.40	\$45,229.92	\$57,114.48	\$60,985.02	\$30,975.60	\$31,996.53
Calculation for Estimated Quantities in Bid for City of Ocala										
	Gasoline - 330,579.10g	\$37,064.53	\$27,471.12	\$29,770.30	\$13,553.74	\$15,388.46	\$15,603.33	\$17,619.87	\$6,281.00	\$6,728.61
	Diesel - 500,118.8g	\$60,204.30	\$35,958.54	\$39,906.98	\$27,906.63	\$30,802.32	\$39,759.44	\$42,237.53	\$22,055.24	\$22,727.90
	TOTAL	\$97,268.83	\$63,429.66	\$69,677.28	\$41,460.37	\$46,190.77	\$55,362.78	\$59,857.40	\$28,336.24	\$29,456.51
	Grand Total for Bulk Fuel to Both City of Ocala and The School Board of Marion County, Florida	\$187,752.24	\$119,060.70	\$131,203.39	\$82,322.77	\$91,420.69	\$112,477.26	\$120,842.42	\$59,311.84	\$61,453.04

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"								
Bid Tabulation Posted: 4/21/23								
BID #3980GM								
Bid Title: Gasoline, Diesel, and Biodiesel, Joint Entity Term Contract ~ Term: May 30, 2023 to June 30, 2024								
Date & Time Due: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 @ 2:00 PM								
Board Date: May 9, 2023								
Vendor Name - No Response								Vendor Name - No Bid
AIW Inc	Orlando	FL		Lynch Oil	Bradenton	FL		
Almond Oil Company	Gainesville	FL		Lynch Oil Company	Kissimmee	FL		
American Compliance Technologies, inc.	Bartow	FL		Mastercard International	Purchase	NY		
ASSOCIATED ENERGY GROUP, LLC	MIAMI	FL		MIDSTREAM FUEL SERVICE LLC.	Tampa	Florida		
Brad Hall & Associates	Idaho Falls	ID		On-Site Fuel Service	brandon	ms		
Circle K	Tampa	FL		Palmdale Oil Company	Ft. Pierce	FL		
City of Ocala	Ocala	FL		PALMDALE OIL COMPANY	tampa	FL		
Cornerstone Energy Corporation	Batesville	IN		PAPCO	Virginia Beach	VA		
Cummins	Jacksonville	FL		Pasco County Schools	Land O' Lakes	Florida		
DORLY PETROLEUM TRADING CO. LTD.	LAUREL	MARYLAND		Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc.	Huntington Beach	CA		
DORLY PETROLEUM TRADING COMPANY LLC	Gaithersburg	MD		Ports Petroleum	Wooster	Ohio		
East River Energy, Inc.	Guilford	CT		Ports Petroleum Co	Naples	FL		
Fleetwing Corporation	Lakeland	FL		Pro Energy LLC	Sunrise	FL		
GBS Funding / GBS Med Pharm	Bowie	MD		Quick Fuel Fleet Service LLC	Orlando	FL		
Grainger	Lake Forest	IL		Reliance Petroleum Holdings LLC	Ocala	FL		
Great Lakes Petroleum	Cleveland	OH		Reliance Petroleum Holdings, LLC	Ocala	FL		
Heritage-Crystal Clean, LLC	Hoffman Estates	IL		RKA Petroleum Companies, Inc.	Romulus	MI		
Hightowers Petroleum Corporation	Middletown	OH		SEMINOLE TRIBE OF FL	HOLLYWOOD	FL		
J. H. Williams Oil Company	Tampa	FL		SSI Lubricants, LLC	Winter Haven	FL		
James River Solutions	Ashland	VA		Stone Petroleum Products	Ocala	FL		
Keeman Petroleum Company	Naples	FL		Stone Petroleum Products Inc	Bellevue	FL		
Land and Sea Petroleum Holdings, Inc.	Ft. Lauderdale	FL		Sun Coast Resources, Inc.	Houston	TX		
Lewis Oil Company	Gainesville	FL		Synergy Recycling	Kingsland	GA		
Lucky Penny, LLC	Brandon	MS		TAC Energy	Dallas	TX		
LV HIERS INC	macclenny	fl		Transformational Consulting for Business	Tampa	FL		
Lykins Companies	Naples	FL		TV Guy Orlando, LLC	Orlando	FL		
Lykins Energy Solutions	Milford	oh		WEST COAST PETROLEUM LLC.	VALRICO	FLORIDA		
				World Fuel Services	Miami	FL		

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARION COUNTY FLORIDA, "AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY SCHOOL DISTRICT"

Bid Tabulation Posted: 4/21/23

BID #3980GM

Bid Title: Gasoline, Diesel, and Biodiesel, Joint Entity Term Contract ~ Term: May 30, 2023 to June 30, 2024

Date & Time Due: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 @ 2:00 PM

Board Date: May 9, 2023

BID RECOMMENDATION SIGNATURE

Recommend the vendors/items that are bolded, high-lighted in yellow,
within a bold outline, as the lowest and best Bid meeting the Boards recommendations.

Rick H. Collins, Purchasing Specialist

Witness

Date

Failure to File a Protest with the time prescribed in s.120.57(3) Florida Statutes,
shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.