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COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT FOR COMMERCIAL DIVING SERVICES: REPAIR OF 
UNDERWATER PIPES AND STRUCTURES 

THIS COOPERATIVE PURCHASING AGREEMENT FOR COMMERCIAL DIVING SERVICES: 
REPAIR OF UNDERWATER PIPES AND STRUCTURES (“Piggyback Agreement”) is entered into by and 
between the CITY OF OCALA, a Florida municipal corporation (“City”) and IN DEPTH INC., a for-
profit corporation duly organized and authorized to do business in the state of Florida (EIN: 82-
1293180) (“Contractor”). 

WHEREAS, after a competitive procurement process, City of Fort Lauderdale entered into a 
contract with In Depth Inc. for the provision of commercial diving services for the repair of underwater 
pipes and structures, contract number 136-0 (the “City of Fort Lauderdale Agreement”); and 

WHEREAS, in accordance with Chapter 287, Florida Statutes and the City of Ocala’s 
contracting and procurement policies and procedures, City has the legal authority to “piggyback” the 
purchase of goods and services as contracted by another governmental entity as a form of inter-
governmental cooperative purchasing when seeking to utilize the same or similar services provided 
for in said contract; and  

WHEREAS, City desires to purchase labor, services, and materials for the provision of 
commercial diving services for the repair of underwater pipes and structures pursuant to essentially 
the same terms and conditions provided under the City of Fort Lauderdale Agreement as applicable 
and amended by the terms and conditions of this Piggyback Agreement; and 

WHEREAS, Contractor agrees to extend the terms, conditions, and pricing of the City of Fort 
Lauderdale Agreement to the City of Ocala, subject to the terms and conditions of the Piggyback 
Agreement.  

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing recitals, the following mutual covenants 
and conditions, and other good and valuable consideration, City and Contractor agree as follows: 

1. RECITALS.  City and Contractor hereby represent, warrant, and agree that the Recitals set forth 
above are true and correct and are incorporated herein by reference.   

2. DEFINITIONS. As used in this Piggyback Agreement, the following terms shall have the meaning 
specified below: 

A. Piggyback Agreement: shall mean this Cooperative Purchasing Agreement for 
commercial diving services as it may from time to time be amended or modified pursuant 
to its terms and provisions. 

B. City of Fort Lauderdale Agreement: shall mean the Agreement for commercial diving 
services for the repair of underwater pipes and structures between City of Fort Lauderdale 
and In Depth Inc., and its exhibits, as amended and attached hereto as Exhibit A – Fort 
Lauderdale Agreement. 

3. INCORPORATION OF CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE AGREEMENT. The Fort Lauderdale 
Agreement attached hereto as Exhibit A is hereby incorporated by reference as if set forth herein 
in its entirety. However, to the extent that any terms and conditions set forth in the City of Fort 
Lauderdale Agreement conflict with any of the amended or supplemental terms and conditions 
set forth in this Piggyback Agreement, then the amended and supplemental terms and 
conditions set forth in this Piggyback Agreement shall be given precedence. 
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4. CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. The Contract Documents which comprise the entire understanding 
between City and Contractor shall only include this Agreement and those documents listed in 
this section as Exhibits to this Agreement. Each of these documents are incorporated herein by 
reference for all purposes.  If there is a conflict between the terms of this Agreement and the 
Contract Documents, then the terms of this Agreement shall control, amend, and supersede any 
conflicting terms contained in the remaining Contract Documents. 

Exhibits to Agreement:  The Exhibits to this Agreement are as follows: 

A. Exhibit A: Fort Lauderdale Agreement (A-1 through A-108) 

B. Exhibit B:  City of Ocala Price Proposal (B-1 through B-10) 

5. AMENDED TERMS AND CONDITIONS. The following terms and conditions of the City of Fort 
Lauderdale Agreement are modified and replaced, in their entirety, as follows: 

A. The terms “City of Fort Lauderdale,” or “City” shall be replaced and intended to refer to the 
“City of Ocala.” 

B. COMPENSATION. City shall pay Contractor a price not to exceed the maximum limiting 
amount of FIFTY THOUSAND AND NO/100 DOLLARS ($50,000) over the contract term 
for the performance of the work and in accordance with the contract documents based on 
the most current prices set forth in Exhibit A – Fort Lauderdale Agreement.  

C. TIME FOR PERFORMANCE. This Agreement shall become effective and commence on 
DECEMBER 20, 2024, and continue through and including MARCH 18, 2025.   

D. Invoice Submission. All invoices submitted by Contractor shall include the City Contract 
Number, an assigned Invoice Number, and Invoice Date.  Contractor shall submit the original 
invoice through the responsible City Project Manager at:  City of Ocala Water Resources 
Department 1805 NE 30th Avenue Building 600, Ocala, Florida 34470 Attn: Luis Acosta 
E-Mail: lacosta@ocalafl.gov; Office: (352)-629-8456.  

E. Payment of Invoices by City.  The City Project Manager must review and approve all invoices 
prior to payment.  City Project Manager’s approval shall not be unreasonably withheld, 
conditioned, or delayed.  Payments by City shall be made no later than the time periods 
established in section 218.735, Florida Statutes. 

F. Withholding of Payment.  City reserves the right to withhold, in whole or in part, payment 
for any and all work that: (i) has not been completed by Contractor; (ii) is inadequate or 
defective and has not been remedied or resolved in a manner satisfactory to the City Project 
Manager; or (iii) which fails to comply with any term, condition, or other requirement under 
this Agreement.  Any payment withheld shall be released and remitted to Contractor within 
THIRTY (30) calendar days of the Contractor’s remedy or resolution of the inadequacy or 
defect.   

G. Excess Funds.  If due to mistake or any other reason Contractor receives payment under this 
Agreement in excess of what is provided for by the Agreement, Contractor shall promptly 
notify City upon discovery of the receipt of the overpayment.  Any overpayment shall be 
refunded to City within THIRTY (30) days of Contractor’s receipt of the overpayment or must 
also include interest calculated from the date of the overpayment at the interest rate for 
judgments at the highest rate as allowed by law. 
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H. Amounts Due to the City.  Contractor must be current and remain current in all obligations 
due to the City during the performance of services under the Agreement. Payments to 
Contractor may be offset by any delinquent amounts due to the City or fees and/or charges 
owed to the City.   

I. Tax Exemption.  City is exempt from all federal excise and state sales taxes (State of Florida 
Consumer’s Certification of Exemption 85-8012621655C-9). The City’s Employer 
Identification Number is 59-60000392. Contractor shall not be exempted from paying sales 
tax to its suppliers for materials to fulfill contractual obligations with the City, nor will 
Contractor be authorized to use City’s Tax Exemption Number for securing materials listed 
herein.   

6. PUBLIC RECORDS. Contractor shall comply with all applicable provisions of the Florida Public 
Records Act, Chapter 119, Florida Statutes. Specifically, Contractor shall:  

A. Keep and maintain public records required by the public agency to perform the service. 

B. Upon request from the public agency’s custodian of public records, provide the public agency 
with a copy of the requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied within a 
reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost provided in Chapter 119, Florida 
Statutes, or as otherwise provided by law. 

C. Ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public records 
disclosure requirements are not disclosed except as authorized by law for the duration of the 
contract term and following completion of the contract if Contractor does not transfer the 
records to the public agency. 

D. Upon completion of the contract, transfer, at no cost, to the public agency all public records 
in possession of Contractor or keep and maintain public records required by the public 
agency to perform the service. If Contractor transfers all public records to the public agency 
upon completion of the contract, Contractor shall destroy any duplicate public records that 
are exempt or confidential and exempt from public records disclosure requirements. If 
Contractor keeps and maintains public records upon completion of the contract, Contractor 
shall meet all applicable requirements for retaining public records. All records stored 
electronically must be provided to the public agency, upon request from the public agency’s 
custodian of public records, in a format that is compatible with the information technology 
systems of the public agency. 

IF CONTRACTOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE APPLICATION OF 
CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO CONTRACTOR’S DUTY TO 
PROVIDE PUBLIC RECORDS RELATING TO THIS CONTRACT, CONTACT 
THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS AT: CITY OF OCALA, OFFICE OF 
THE CITY CLERK; 352-629-8266; E-mail: clerk@ocalafl.gov; City Hall, 
110 SE Watula Avenue, Ocala, FL 34471. 

7. AUDIT. Contractor shall comply and cooperate immediately with any inspections, reviews, 
investigations, or audits relating to this Agreement as deemed necessary by the Florida Office of 
the Inspector General, the City’s Internal or External auditors or by any other Florida official with 
proper authority. 
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8. PUBLICITY. Contractor shall not use City’s name, logo, seal or other likeness in any press release, 
marketing materials, or other public announcement without City’s prior written approval. 

9. E-VERIFY. Pursuant to section 448.095, Contractor shall register with and use the U.S. 
Department of Homeland Security’s (“DHS”) E-Verify System, accessible at https://e-
verify.uscis.gov/emp, to verify the work authorization status of all newly hired employees.  
Contractor shall obtain affidavits from any and all subcontractors in accordance with paragraph 
2(b) of section 448.095, Florida Statutes, and maintain copies of such affidavits for the duration 
of this Agreement.  By entering into this Agreement, Contractor certifies and ensures that it 
utilizes and will continue to utilize the DHS E-Verify System for the duration of this Agreement 
and any subsequent renewals of same.  Contractor understands that failure to comply with the 
requirements of this section shall result in the termination of this Agreement and Contractor may 
lose the ability to be awarded a public contract for a minimum of one (1) year after the date on 
which the Agreement was terminated.  Contractor shall provide a copy of its DHS Memorandum 
of Understanding upon City’s request.  Please visit www.e-verify.gov for more information 
regarding the E-Verify System. 

10. CONFLICT OF INTEREST. Contractor is required to have disclosed, with the submission of their 
bid, the name of any officer, director, or agent who may be employed by the City. Contractor 
shall further disclose the name of any City employee who owns, directly or indirectly, any interest 
in Contractor’s business or any affiliated business entity. Any additional conflicts of interest that 
may occur during the contract term must be disclosed to the City of Ocala Procurement 
Department.  

11. WAIVER. The failure or delay of any party at any time to require performance by another party 
of any provision of this Agreement, even if known, shall not affect the right of such party to 
require performance of that provision or to exercise any right, power, or remedy hereunder. Any 
waiver by any party of any breach of any provision of this Agreement should not be construed 
as a waiver of any continuing or succeeding breach of such provision, a waiver of the provision 
itself, or a waiver of any right, power, or remedy under this Agreement. No notice to or demand 
on any party in any circumstance shall, of itself, entitle such party to any other or further notice 
or demand in similar or other circumstances. 

12. SEVERABILITY OF ILLEGAL PROVISIONS. Wherever possible, each provision of this Agreement 
shall be interpreted in such a manner as to be effective and valid under the applicable law. Should 
any portion of this Agreement be declared invalid for any reason, such declaration shall have no 
effect upon the remaining portions of this Agreement.  

13. INDEMNITY. Contractor shall indemnify City and its elected officials, employees and volunteers 
against, and hold City and its elected officials, employees and volunteers harmless from, all 
damages, claims, losses, costs, and expenses, including reasonable attorneys’ fees, which City or 
its elected officials, employees or volunteers may sustain, or which may be asserted against City 
or its elected officials, employees or volunteers, arising out of the activities contemplated by this 
Agreement including, without limitation, harm or personal injury to third persons during the term 
of this Agreement to the extent attributable to the actions of Contractor, its agents, and 
employees.  

14. NO WAIVER OF SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY. Nothing herein is intended to waive sovereign 
immunity by the City to which sovereign immunity may be applicable, or of any rights or limits 
of liability existing under Florida Statute § 768.28. This term shall survive the termination of all 
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performance or obligations under this Agreement and shall be fully binding until any proceeding 
brought under this Agreement is barred by any applicable statute of limitations.  

15. NOTICES. All notices, certifications or communications required by this Agreement shall be given 
in writing and shall be deemed delivered when personally served, or when received if by facsimile 
transmission with a confirming copy mailed by registered or certified mail, postage prepaid, 
return receipt requested. Notices can be concurrently delivered by e-mail. All notices shall be 
addressed to the respective parties as follows: 

 
If to Contractor:   In Depth Inc. 
     Attention: Zachary J. Rogers 

      1473 Old Haw Creek Road 
      Bunnell, Florida 32110 
      Phone: 386-202-2771 
      E-mail: zach@indepthservicesinc.com  

If to City of Ocala:   Daphne M. Robinson, Esq., Contracting Officer 
      City of Ocala 

110 SE Watula Avenue, 3rd Floor 
      Ocala, Florida 34471 
      Phone: 352-629-8343 
      E-mail: notices@ocalafl.gov 

Copy to:     William E. Sexton, Esq., City Attorney 
City of Ocala 

             110 SE Watula Avenue, 3rd Floor 
      Ocala, Florida 34471 
      Phone: 352-401-3972 
      E-mail: cityattorney@ocalafl.gov 

16. ATTORNEYS' FEES. If any civil action, arbitration or other legal proceeding is brought for the 
enforcement of this Agreement, or because of an alleged dispute, breach, default or 
misrepresentation in connection with any provision of this Agreement, the successful or 
prevailing party shall be entitled to recover reasonable attorneys' fees, sales and use taxes, court 
costs and all expenses reasonably incurred even if not taxable as court costs (including, without 
limitation, all such fees, taxes, costs and expenses incident to arbitration, appellate, bankruptcy 
and post-judgment proceedings), incurred in that civil action, arbitration or legal proceeding, in 
addition to any other relief to which such party or parties may be entitled. Attorneys' fees shall 
include, without limitation, paralegal fees, investigative fees, administrative costs, sales and use 
taxes and all other charges reasonably billed by the attorney to the prevailing party.  

17. JURY WAIVER. IN ANY CIVIL ACTION, COUNTERCLAIM, OR PROCEEDING, 
WHETHER AT LAW OR IN EQUITY, WHICH ARISES OUT OF, CONCERNS, OR 
RELATES TO THIS AGREEMENT, ANY AND ALL TRANSACTIONS CONTEMPLATED 
HEREUNDER, THE PERFORMANCE HEREOF, OR THE RELATIONSHIP CREATED 
HEREBY, WHETHER SOUNDING IN CONTRACT, TORT, STRICT LIABILITY, OR 
OTHERWISE, TRIAL SHALL BE TO A COURT OF COMPETENT JURISDICTION AND 
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NOT TO A JURY. EACH PARTY HEREBY IRREVOCABLY WAIVES ANY RIGHT IT MAY 
HAVE TO A TRIAL BY JURY. NEITHER PARTY HAS MADE OR RELIED UPON ANY 
ORAL REPRESENTATIONS TO OR BY ANY OTHER PARTY REGARDING THE 
ENFORCEABILITY OF THIS PROVISION. EACH PARTY HAS READ AND 
UNDERSTANDS THE EFFECT OF THIS JURY WAIVER PROVISION. 

18. GOVERNING LAW. This Agreement is and shall be deemed to be a contract entered and made 
pursuant to the laws of the State of Florida and shall in all respects be governed, construed, 
applied, and enforced in accordance with the laws of the State of Florida. 

19. JURISDICTION AND VENUE. The parties acknowledge that a majority of the negotiations, 
anticipated performance and execution of this Agreement occurred or shall occur in Marion 
County, Florida. Any civil action or legal proceeding arising out of or relating to this Agreement 
shall be brought only in the courts of record of the State of Florida in Marion County or the 
United States District Court, Middle District of Florida, Ocala Division. Each party consents to the 
exclusive jurisdiction of such court in any such civil action or legal proceeding and waives any 
objection to the laying of venue of any such civil action or legal proceeding in such court and/or 
the right to bring an action or proceeding in any other court. Service of any court paper may be 
effected on such party by mail, as provided in this Agreement, or in such other manner as may 
be provided under applicable laws, rules of procedures or local rules.  

20. REFERENCE TO PARTIES. Each reference herein to the parties shall be deemed to include their 
successors, assigns, heirs, administrators, and legal representatives, all whom shall be bound by 
the provisions hereof. 

21. MUTUALITY OF NEGOTIATION. Contractor and City acknowledge that this Agreement is a 
result of negotiations between Contractor and City, and the Agreement shall not be construed in 
favor of, or against, either party because of that party having been more involved in the drafting 
of the Agreement. 

22. SECTION HEADINGS. The section headings herein are included for convenience only and shall 
not be deemed to be a part of this Agreement.  

23. RIGHTS OF THIRD PARTIES. Nothing in this Agreement, whether express or implied, is intended 
to confer any rights or remedies under or because of this Agreement on any persons other than 
the parties hereto and their respective legal representatives, successors and permitted assigns. 
Nothing in this Agreement is intended to relieve or discharge the obligation or liability of any 
third persons to any party to this Agreement, nor shall any provision give any third persons any 
right of subrogation or action over or against any party to this Agreement. 

24. AMENDMENT. No amendment to this Agreement shall be effective except those agreed to in 
writing and signed by both parties to this Agreement. 

25. COUNTERPARTS. This Agreement may be executed in counterparts, each of which shall be an 
original and all of which shall constitute the same instrument. 

26. ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE(S). Contractor, if and by offering an electronic signature in any form 
whatsoever, will accept and agree to be bound by said electronic signature to all terms and 
conditions of this Agreement. Further, a duplicate or copy of the Agreement that contains a 
duplicated or non-original signature will be treated the same as an original, signed copy of this 
original Agreement for all purposes.  
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27. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This Agreement, including exhibits, (if any) constitutes the entire 
Agreement between the parties hereto with respect to the subject matter hereof. There are no 
other representations, warranties, promises, agreements, or understandings, oral, written, or 
implied, among the Parties, except to the extent reference is made thereto in this Agreement. No 
course of prior dealings between the parties and no usage of trade shall be relevant or admissible 
to supplement, explain, or vary any of the terms of this Agreement. No representations, 
understandings, or agreements have been made or relied upon in the making of this Agreement 
other than those specifically set forth herein. 

28. LEGAL AUTHORITY. Each person signing this Agreement on behalf of either party individually 
warrants that he or she has full legal power to execute this Agreement on behalf of the party for 
whom he or she is signing, and to bind and obligate such party with respect to all provisions 
contained in this Agreement. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Agreement on _______________________. 

 

ATTEST: CITY OF OCALA 
 
 
______________________________________ 
Angel B. Jacobs 
City Clerk 

 
 
________________________________________ 
Ken Whitehead 
Assistant City Manager 
 

  
Approved as to form and legality: 
 
 
______________________________________ 
William E. Sexton, Esq. 
City Attorney 

IN DEPTH INC. 
 
 
__________________________________________ 
 
 
By: ______________________________________ 
                           (Printed Name) 
 
 
 

Title:  ____________________________________ 
              (Title of Authorized Signatory) 
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Bunnell Office • 1473 Old Haw Creek Road, Bunnell FL 32110 • Tel (386) 202-2771 • Email info@indepthservicesinc.com • indepthservicesinc.com

Sincerely,

Zach Rogers
President
InDepth Services, Inc.
(386) 202-2771
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November 20, 2024 
  
  
  
  
  
  
City of Ocala 
Attn:  Luis Acosta 
110 SE Watula Avenue 
Ocala, FL  34471 
  
  
  
RE:  Piggyback Contract with City of Fort Lauderdale contract # Solicitation Event No. 136 
  
Dear Luis, 
  
In Depth Inc., is the proud contract holder for the City of Fort Lauderdale - Agreement for Commercial Diving Services - 
Solicitation Event No. 136 for the cleaning, inspections and repair of water tanks along with any other diving service the city 
might need.  We are pleased to offer the City of Ocala the opportunity to Piggy-Back this contract that is in effect from the date 
of March 19, 2024 through March 18, 2025, with the option of one (3), one-year renewals upon mutual consent, per City of Fort 
Lauderdale Solicitation Event No. 136. 
  
In Depth Inc., will honor the pricing from the original agreement. 
  
Please let me know if you have any questions or if you need any additional information.
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City of Ocala

Attn:  Luis Acosta
110 SE Watula Avenue
Ocala, FL  34471

Phone:  

Cell:    

352-629-8457

352-572-0421

Email:   jlacosta@ocalafl.org 

Contract #  D - 0610

Date: 11/20/2024 

Diving Services for Cleaning and Inspection of Potable Water Tanks

Tanks Tank Description Additional Information 
Scope of Work  

To Include

1 

Uptown
1MG - Concrete GST

Approx. 97' x 18'
Discharged water will NOT 
require de-chlorination or 

sediment bags 

Clean and Inspect

Up to three (3) inches of
sediment removal from

the tank floors.
Includes up to one hour of
debris removal per tank at

no additional chargeDischarged water and 
sediment may be released 
onto nearby catch basin 

Visual inspection of the
interior and exterior

of the tank.

Written report with photos
and a DVD of the dive.

1

State Route 40
1MG - Concrete GST

Approx. 84' x 24'

1

1

1

WTP #1  -  Tank #2
2 MG GST - Concrete

Approx. 110' x 25

REF: Fort Lauderdale 
Agreement for

Commercial Diving
Services

Solicitation Event No. 136

Henry Street Tower
500KG - Pedestal

Approx 200'Tall x 25' Deep

Line Item # 23  $3,350.00

WTP #1 - Tank #1
2MG GST - Concrete

Approx. 110' x 25'

Line Item #22   $6,300.00

Line Item # 22   $6,300.00

Line Item#22   $6,300.00

Line Item #22   $6,300.00

1
AQua-Store - Reuse Tank

183KG  GST
Diam 30.77' x 33.01'H

Line Item #31   $3,350.00

Exhibit B - City of Ocala Price Proposal CONTRACT# WRS/250225
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Proposal Total: $36,400.00 
Daily rate to be expected on 8hr. work day

The bid price listed above is valid for 90 days from date shown. 
Proposals signed and returned to In Depth Inc. are valid for one year from date of acceptance. 

NOTE: All reports will be signed and sealed by Florida (PE) engineer (if required). 

In Depth Inc is a Certified DBE & MBE Florida Small Business. 

Payment terms: 1% Ten Days, Net 30 Days.  1.5% interest will be charged on all accounts past 30 days. 

This contract is based on a unit price which includes time and mobilization to and from the project site, set-
up and breakdown of equipment, preparation for dive and diving services. Diving services will include 
sediment removal up to 3 inches from the floor, a video inspection and written report for your records (still 
photos included).  During the initial dive, sediment depths will be measured by the diver and documented
on video.  

If removal of sediment is of abnormal consistency (clay, calcium, lime, rocks, pebbles, mud, 
etc.), additional sediment removal (over 3 inches from the floor), wall cleaning or any additional
requested services such as epoxy or miscellaneous repairs, an approval by designated on-site 
representative will be required, in-which each of these services will be performed at a rate of 
$405.00 per hour, plus the cost of any material.  This rate may also apply to any additional hours
worked anticipated the 8hr expected working day. If the specified scope of work is required to be 
performed on a weekend and/or Holiday, an additional $850.00 surcharge will be applied per day. 

In Depth Inc. will provide all personnel and equipment necessary to perform diving services in the above 
referenced tank(s) or reservoir(s). The tank(s) or reservoir(s) will be cleaned and meet the requirements 
according to FL DEP Rule 62-555.350, American Water Works Association (AWWA), NACE, SSPC, 
ASNT, ACI and AWS standards. 

• All divers employed by In Depth Inc. are certified Commercial Divers.
• In Depth Inc. is fully bondable and insured.
• In Depth Inc is a Certified DBE & MBE Florida Small Business
• All equipment entering the tanks will be disinfected with a minimum of 200 ppm Chlorine.
• Schedule dates are tentative and are subject to change.
• In Depth Inc reserves the right to sub-contract any or all of these services out to another

contractor of choice.
• If In Depth Inc. dive team is required to stop working or is delayed working due to unforeseen

circumstances or any reasons beyond our control (i.e. no utility personnel onsite, inability
to access designated work site, low water level, etc.) a down-time charge of $405.00 per hour
will be charged.

• A fee based on $405.00 per hour will be charged if we are unable to get our truck and trailer
to a tank location. We will use portable dive gear and cleaning equipment to complete the
job. Please understand that use of utility vehicles or equipment may be necessary to get our
equipment to a tank.

• In Depth Inc. makes every attempt to obtain complete information from customers prior to
the presentation of bids concerning fees required for municipal licenses, registration fees,
Sales Tax or Use Taxes in your area.  These items are identified on your contract.  In the
event that additional fees are discovered or charged, after the bid has been submitted, these
charges will be added to the stated contract amount when billed.

1

268KG Clearwell
2 Clearwells Side by Side

24' x 134'
Line Item #25    $4,500.00

Exhibit B - City of Ocala Price Proposal CONTRACT# WRS/250225
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• Provision for Other Agencies - Unless otherwise stipulated by In Depth Inc, In Depth Inc.,
agrees to make available to all Government agencies, departments, and municipalities the
quoted prices submitted in accordance with said maintenance contract terms and
conditions therein, should any said governmental entity desire to buy under this proposal.
Eligible Users shall mean all state agencies, legislative and judicial branches, political
subdivisions (counties, district school boards, colleges, municipalities, or other public
agencies or authorities), which may desire to purchase under the terms and conditions of
the contract. The client binding this contract shall not be liable for the obligations of another
agency which uses this maintenance contract under this provision.

Sue Couslin, Regional Account Manager  Date: ___/___/____  Approval initial:________

To accept, please sign and date proposal, then scan and Email both pages to: sue@indepthservicesinc.com 

__________________________________________ ___________________ 
Printed Name and Title  Date 

__________________________________________ 
Signature 

Completion Date – With acceptance this work will be completed at a mutually acceptable date within 
one year.  If the budgeted funds for this work has to be used by a specific date, please indicate the date  
here: _____/____/_______

Important Information:  Please Read and Show Acceptance 

Water Level and Accessibility - Please initial below that you have been advised, and understand, the 
entry point must be at least 24” in diameter and all structures must be filled to their maximum level prior to 
the dive teams’ arrival.  A $2,000.00 cancellation trip charge will be levied if the team is unable to work due 
to low water level or any access issues what so ever, including; inaccessible roadways, access hatch size 
to small, high radio/antenna frequency levels, or unsafe / inaccessible ladders. 

     Utility Representative Initial Here _______ 

Structure Information – Please initial below to verify the type of structure, dimensions or information 
listed in the proposal is accurate.  If the structure dimensions or information is not accurate as listed then 
additional costs may be added.  

    Utility Representative Initial Here ________ 

Exhibit B - City of Ocala Price Proposal CONTRACT# WRS/250225
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Name  Location Index Code Type of Tank Tank 
Construction

Hatch Size 
and Location 

(s)
Tank Dimensions

Tank Capacity
(in gallons)

Ladders
 (internal)

Ladders 
(external)

Safety Climb 
Cable,

 Rail or Cage
Vehicle Access 110V on site Approx. Year Built Last Inspected Last Cleaned

Expected Findings
(i.e., sand, silt, 

iron, Manganese, 
etc.)

Cleaning and 
Inspection 

Time

Fiveash Tank #1

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

7404 On ground Concrete
28” X 28” roof 

hatch,3 
manways

Dia. 186’
Ht. 32’

7 MG YES YES YES YES YES 1999 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

FiveashTank #2

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

7404 On ground Concrete
55” X 48” roof 

hatch,2 
manways

Dia. 147.6’
Ht. 32’

5 MG YES YES YES YES YES 1975 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Peele Dixie
 South Tank

1500 S. State
 Road 7, 

Fort Lauderdale, 
FL. 33317 

7406 On ground Concrete
35” X 44” roof 

hatch,2 
manways

Dia. 145’
Ht.31.5'

4 MG YES YES YES YES YES 2006 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Peele Dixie 
North Tank

1500 S. State
 Road 7, 

Fort Lauderdale, 
FL. 33317 

7406 On ground Concrete
35” X 44” roof 

hatch,2 
manways

Dia. 145’
Ht.31.5'

4 MG YES YES YES YES YES 2006 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Poinciana Park 

2010 SE 4
 Avenue, Fort
 Lauderdale,
 FL. 33316

7404 On ground Concrete Roof hatch,2 
manways

Dia. 82’
Ht. 50’

2 MG YES YES YES YES YES 2006 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Second Avenue

625 NW 2nd
 Avenue, Fort
 Lauderdale,
 FL. 33311

Elevated Welded Steal

24” X 24” roof 
hatch,1 oval 
manways at 

the riser

Dia.78’
Overall Ht.156’ 

8”
    Riser Dia. 96 “
   Riser Ht. 95’ 8”

1 MG YES YES YES YES N/A
1950

Rebuilt 2019
2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #1

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete
3 hatches, 24" 

x 36", no
 ladders

Lt. 160’  X 
Wd.153' 

X Dep.12'
0.98 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #2

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete 1 hatch, 
no ladder

Lt. 138’  X Wd.50' 
X Dep.12'

0.49 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #3

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete 2 hatches, 
no ladders

Lt. 55’  X Wd.37 
X Dep.12'

0.17 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #4

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete 1 hatch, 
no ladder

Lt. 48’  X Wd.30' 
X Dep.16'

0.17 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #5

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete 2 hatch, 
no ladders

Lt. 102’  X Wd.30' 
X Dep.17'

0.37 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #6

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete 4 hatches, 
no ladders

LT. 127’  X 
Wd.28' 

X Dep.12'
0.31 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Fiveash 
Clearwell #7

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete 1 hatch, 
no ladder

Lt. 47’  X Wd.12' 
X Dep.12'

0.05 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Peele Dixie
Clearwell #8

1500 S. State
 Road 7, 

Fort Lauderdale, 
FL. 33317 

7406 On ground Concrete
3 hatches,
 24" x 36", 
no ladders

Lt. 80’  X Wd.32' 
X Dep. 10'

0.18 MG NO N/A N/A YES N/A 2006 2023 2023 Mild Sluge Every 5 years 

Recarbonation
 Basin #1/2

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete Open Lt. 33’  X Wd.27' 
X Dep. 18'

0.121 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2021 2021 Mild Sluge Yearly

Recarbonation
 Basin # 3

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete Open Lt. 27’  X Wd.48' 
X Dep. 21'

0.181 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2021 2021 Mild Sluge Yearly

Recarbonation
 Basin # 4

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete Open Lt. 27’  X Wd.48' 
X Dep. 21'

0.181 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2021 2021 Mild Sluge Yearly

Flumes

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete Open Lt. 2200’  X Wd.5' 
X Dep. 5'

Varies NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2021 2021 Mild Sluge Yearly

South Aeration
 Basin

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete Open Lt. 19’  X Wd.27' 
X Dep. 32'

0.177MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2021 2021 Mild Sluge Yearly

North Aeration
 Basin

949 N.W. 
38th Street,

 Oakland Park,
 Fl. 33309 

On ground Concrete Open Lt. 19’  X Wd.27' 
X Dep. 32'

0.177 MG NO N/A N/A LIMITED N/A 1965 2021 2021 Mild Sluge Yearly
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Line Responses For Event # 136-0 

Line# 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

Company: 10 

Supplier Group: COFL 

Supplier Contact: 1 

Item Description 

THREE DIVING THREE DIVING 
CREW CREW 
SCHEDULED SCHEDULED 
RATE RATE 

RATE FOR THREE DIVING 
NIGHTS/WEEKE CREW 
NOS/HOLIDAY SCHEDULED 

RATE FOR 
NIGHTS/WEEKE 
NOS/HOLIDAY 

DIVING CREW THREE DIVING 
UNSCHEDULED CREW 
RATE UNSCHEDULED 

RATE 

FOUR DIING FOUR DIING 
CREW CREW 
SCHEDULED SCHEDULED 
RATE RATE 

RATE FOR FOUR DIVER 
NIGHTS/WE EKE CREW 
NOS/HOLIDAY SCHEDULED 

RATE FOR 
NIGHTS/WEEKE 
N OS/HOLi DAYS 

CREWS FOUR DIVER 
UNSCHEDULED CREWS 
RATE UNSCHEDULED 

RATE 

HYDRAULIC HYDRAULIC 
ROUGH ROUGH 
TERRAIN CRANE TERRAIN CRANE 

Vendor Item 

Event #: 136-0 

Supplier: 654 

Supplier Contact Name: Zachary Rogers 

Vendor Item Line Response Unit of 
Description Quantity Quantity Measure 

60.0000 60.0000 HR 

60.0000 60.0000 HR 

60.0000 60.0000 HR 

40.0000 40.0000 HR 

40.0000 40.0000 HR 

40.0000 40.0000 HR 

5.0000 5.0000 DA 
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Un it Price 

405.0000000 
0 

635.0000000 
0 

955.0000000 
0 

495.0000000 
0 

745.0000000 
0 

1, 125.000000 
00 

5,500.000000 
00 

EXHIBIT B 

Event Name: Commercial Diving Services 

Supplier Name: In Depth Inc 

No No Respo Questi Is 
Char Bi nse ons Awar 
ge d No Bid Reason Exists Exist ded 

No No Yes No No 

No No Yes No No 

No No Yes No No 

No No Yes No No 

No No Yes No No 

No No Yes No No 

No No Yes No No 
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Line Responses For Event # 136-0 continued ... 

No No Respo Questi Is 
Vendor Item Line Response Unit of Char Bi nse ons Awar 

Line# Item Description Vendor Item Description Quantity Quantity Measure Unit Price ge d No Bid Reason Exists Exist ded 

8 DISCHARGING 4" HYDRAULIC 40.0000 40.0000 HR 155.0000000 No No Yes No No 
HOSE PUMP 400' 0 

DISCHARGING 
HOSE 

9 DISCHARGING 6" HYDRAULIC 40.0000 40.0000 HR 300.0000000 No No Yes No No 
HOSE PUMP WITH 0 

400' 
DISCHARGING 
HOSE 

10 VACUUM TRUCK VACUUM TRUCK 40.0000 40.0000 HR 625.0000000 No No Yes No No 
0 

11 CONSTRUCTION FLOATING 5.0000 5.0000 DA 4,100. 000000 No No Yes No No 
PLATFORM CONSTRUCTION 00 
WITH BOBCA PLATFORM 

WITH BOBCAT 
E35 I OR EQUAL 

12 FLOATING FLOATING 40.0000 40.0000 HR 315. 0000000 No No Yes No No 
STORAGE STORAGE 0 
PLATFORM PLATFORM 

WITH MINIMUM 
4 CY CAPACITY 

13 LONG STICK LONG STICK 5.0000 5.0000 DA 7,500.000000 No No Yes No No 
EXCAVATOR EXCAVATOR 00 

CAT 325 OR 
EQUAL 

14 TURBIDITY TURBIDITY 40.0000 40.0000 HR 100.0000000 No No Yes No No 
BARRIER FOOT BARRIER FOOT 0 
104-11 104-11 

15 CLOSED CLOSED 20.0000 20.0000 HR 125.0000000 No No Yes No No 
CIRCUIT VIDEO CIRCUIT VIDEO 0 
SYSTEM SYSTEM WITH 

DVD COPY 

16 HYDRAULIC HYDRAULIC 40.0000 40.0000 HR 100.0000000 No No Yes No No 
TOOLS TOOLS 0 
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Line Responses For Event # 136-0 continued ... 

No No Respo Questi Is 

Vendor Item Line Response Unit of Char Bi nse ons Awar 

Line# Item Description Vendor Item Description Quantity Quantity Measure Unit Price ge d No Bid Reason Exists Exist ded 

17 PUSH BOATS PUSH BOATS 40.0000 40.0000 HR 250.0000000 No No Yes No No 
0 

18 FIVEASH TANK ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 11,000.00000 No No Yes No No 

#1 CONCRETE 000 
TANK 28"28" 
ROOF HATCH 
MANWAYS 

19 FIVEASH TANK ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 9,500.000000 No No Yes No No 

#2 CONCRETE 00 

TANK 
55"48"ROOF 
HATCH 2 
MANWAYS 
186X32 

*2 PEELE DIXIE ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 9,500.000000 No No Yes No No 

0 SOUTH TANK CONCRETE 00 

TANK 35"X44 " 
ROOF HATCH 2 
MANWAYS 4MIL 
GA 

21 .PEELE DIXIE ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 9,500.000000 No No Yes No No 

NORTH TANK CONCRETE 00 
TANK 35"X44" 
ROOFHATCH 2 
MANWAYS 4MG 

22 POINCIANA ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 6,300.000000 No No Yes No No 

PARK CONCRETE 00 
TANK ROOF 
HATCH 2 
MANWAYS 2MG 

23 SECOND ELEVATED 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,350.000000 No No Yes No No 

AVENUE WELDED STEEL 00 
24X24 ROOF 
HATCH 1 
MANWAY lMG 
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Line Responses For Event # 136-0 continued ... 

- ·- ' 

~ ~ _i,., .~ 1 • • ' ' 

No No Respo Quest i Is 
Vendor Item Line Response Unit of Char Bi nse ons Awar 

Line# Item Description Vendor Item Description Quantity Quantity Measure Unit Price ge d No Bid Reason Exists Exist ded 

24 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 6,300.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL #1 CONCRETE 3 00 

HATCHES NO 
LADDER 
0.98MG 

25 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 4,500.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL #2 CONCRETE 1 00 

HATCH NO 
LADDER 0.49M 

26 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,750.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL # 3 CONCRETE 2 00 

HATCH NO 
LADDERS 
0.17MG 

27 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 4,500.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL #4 CONCRETE 1 00 

HATCH 0.17MG 

28 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,350.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL # 5 CONCRETE 2 00 

HATCH 0.37MG 

29 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,350.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL #6 CONCRETE 4 00 

HATCH 0.31MG 

30 FIVE ASH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3, 150.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL #7 CONCRETE 1 00 

HATCH 0.05MG 

31 PEELE DIXIE ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,350.000000 No No Yes No No 
CLEARWELL #8 CONCRETE 3 00 

HATCH 0.18MG 

32 RECARBONATIO ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,150.000000 No No Yes No No 
N BASIN #1/2 CONCRETE 00 

open 0.121MG 

33 RECARBONATIO ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,150.000000 No No Yes No No 
N BASIN #3 CONCRETE 00 

open 0.181MG 
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Line Responses For Event # 136-0 cont inued ... 

No No Respo Questi Is 
Vendor Item Line Response Unit of Char Bi nse ons Awar 

Line# Item Description Vendor Item Description Quantity Quantity Measure Unit Price ge d No Bid Reason Exists Exist ded 

34 RECARBONATIO ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,150.000000 No No Yes No No 
N BASIN #4 CONCRETE 00 

open 0.181MG 

35 ON GROUND ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 12,000.00000 No No Yes No No 
CONCRETE CONCRETE 000 
OPEN FLUMES open FLUMES 

VARIES 

36 SOUTH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,150.000000 No No Yes No No 
AERATION CONCRETE 00 
BASIN open BASIN 

0.177MG 

37 NORTH ON GROUND 1.0000 1.0000 JA 3,150.000000 No No Yes No No 
AERATION CONCRETE 00 
BASIN open BASIN 

0.177MG 
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