BID TABULATION & NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

ProRFx ID: ITB10122200000187 Buyer: Eileen Marquez
Notifications Sent: 109 Buyer Phone: 352-629-8362
Bids: 4 Email: emarquez@ocalafl.org
2/1/2023 Notice of Intent to Award to Henry Schein Medical EMS, Life-Assist, Inc,, and Bound Tree Medical pending City Council approval.
ITB# OFR/220860 Emergency Medical Service School Health Corporation Henry Schein Medical EMS Life-Assist, Inc. Bound Tree Medical
Supplies Rolling Meadows, IL Irmo, SC Rancho Cordova, CA Dublin, OH
# Description nit of ]t Yealy | it price | Extended Cost | Vendor Product# | comments [ unit Price | Extende Cost | vendor Product# Comments Unit Price | Extended Cost | Vendor Producti Comments Unit Price | Extended Cost Vendor Product Comments
1 [12vDC battery for Laerdal suction unit Each 6 5000 5000 $12319 73914 a7 $11989 71934 oKese113 sss41 | 33246 BTM 1780400 Sold $55.41/ea
3 [ x & Non-sterile Gauze ©ag/200) | @0 w8 62640 27501 s255 $204.00 1408394 a7 s301.60 Bls114 538 43040 BTM 1212-12105 Sold §5.38/200ct bag
4 |ar x 4° sterile Gauze - Single packed ®ox/25) 10 $1322 $1220 27544 $1.25 $1250 1408397 sold 100/bx $5.00 $1.75 $17.50 BAT24 priced as requesed wld a5 | 50,36 $3.60 BTM 121212102 Sold $1.43/100/pk
5 |A8D Pad Bx/16 3 3209 $6288. 1000057 sold as each §1.31 | $1.60 $4.80 5701470 5%9 sold 25/bx $2.50 $224 $672 BASS90 pmed;}i’ff:fii‘:b Sg‘d sl ou 223 BTM 1212-12110 Sold $3.76/25¢t
7 [Ace Wrap 2 Packii) | 2 748 149 31082 39 %7 4595114 45 936 BES02 $287 $574 BTM 112136550 Sold $2.87/10ct
8 [Ace Wrap > Each 2 1836 20900 31093 047 $1175 4995113 sold 10/bx $4.70 5056 $1200 BES03 047 $1175 BTM 1121-36551 Sold $4.67/10ct
9 [Ace Wrap 4 Packii) | 2 $1057 2114 31094 590 $1180 450665 43 $1485 BEs04 563 $11.26 BTM 112136552 Sold $5.63/10ct
10 [Actidose 50 MG, 240 ML Cosery [ 2 5000 000 2340 96460 1306684 sold each 2695 2144 | ssass MD60 10212 20424 8TM 020308 Sold $85i/ea
11 [Adaptic 3 x 3 G50 | 3 511 1533 27009 s18.14 $54.42 1568440 2259 6177 BAGT12 substitution 52213 46639 BTM 082012 Sold $22.13/50ct
12 [Adenocard 6 mg/2 m Prefiled Syringe ©o10 | 5 s000 000 2146 $12230 1404750 Single dose vial $16240 se1200 DRO01-67 52067 | $10335 BTM 0542-02 Sold $20.67/10ct
13 [Abuterol 083% 25 mg/3 mi Govm) [ 3 5000 5000 565 $1635 1154529 $325 $975 DRO200-30 451 $1353 BTM 9501-25 Sold $3.76/25ct
14 [Acohol Preps ©ox/200) | 10 5246 2260 1040441 118 $11.80 5702219 77 s ALTo07 158 $1560 BTM 132085200 Sold $1.58/200ct
15 [Ambubag Adult - AF 1000 Series Latex Free - 845211 ®ox10) 3 5000 5000 %1 $288.30 4993940 B <0420 $252.60 oMs011 priced as requested, sold s g16270 | sassi10 BTM 2442-BVMPSA Sold $16.27/ea
16 [Ambubag Infant - 540212000 casete) | 1 s000 000 19104 | s191.08 4999928 Sold each $11.94 207 2nn omr2000 priced as requested. wld a5 | 51627 $16.27 BTM 2442-BVMPIN Sold $16.27/ea
17 [Ambubag Peds - AF 1000 Seres Latex Free - 845221 Pediatric Each) 15 5000 5000 114 $179.10 4996431 Ambu 530213000 842 $126.30 oms021 $627 52405 BTM 2442-BVMPSA Sold $16.27/ea
18 [Amiodarane HCI 150 MG (S0mg/m) Single Dose Vie Packi2s) | 2 $000 000 4367 $87.34 1380951 s2074 | satas DROS75-25 $5201 s11802 87M 987520 Sold $59.01/25ct
19 [Ammonia inhalants 33 mi ®o10 [ 1 5000 5000 24 244 1422556 5245 245 Ave2 substitution s2.41 s241 BTM 1360-62022 Sold $2.41/10ct
20 |arm Board 18" Each) s 5000 000 B sass 5089 s445 180D 21 $1065 8TM 450002 Sold $2.13/ea
21 |am Board & Each) 5 5000 5000 5088 440 s052 260 90D 106 530 BTM 450004 Sold $1.06/ea
22 [Arm Board Infant - 3" inch €ach) s 000 5000 s0.85 $4.25 $102 510 62306 priced as requested. wld a5 | 43753, $1,86155 BTM 3631-02017 Sold $37231/ea
23 |arm Sing Adjustable - Large €ach) B 704 3520 20197 5410 52050 4520 2620 MEDL ORTI1010 substitution 355 $17.75 BTM 3031-10020 Sold $3.55/ea
24 |Arm Sing Adjustable - Medium Each) 0 5704 1040 2019 410 w100 ssssa7 $524 5240 MEDL ORT11010 substtution 5355 $35.50 BTM 3031-10021 Sold $3.55/ea
25 |arm Sing Adjustable - Smal (€ach) B 4650 3300 20195 5419 52035 1206045 4520 2620 MEDL ORTI1010 substitution $3.48 $17.40 BTM 3031-10019 Sold $3.48/ea
26 |aspirn 81 m Bottles (Chewable) Each) 2 s642 7104 1031656 36/bottle 089 $1068 1381092 $1.00 1200 MD150 5002 5024 BTM 911316 Sold $.69/36ct
27 |atropine 1mg (01 mg/m) - Inj Each) 2 5000 5000 $1002 $2004 2580091 sold 10/bx $10020 | s1102 2200 DR3340.00 $1631 @26 BTM 374911 Sold $163.07/10ct
28 [Baby beanie, pink/blue stripe Each s 5000 000 5056 280 a00121 5018 5090 BS434 023 215 87M 18509 Sold $0.43/ea
29 [Packboard straps - ' cisposable with plastc buckles. No on Each 2 5000 5000 $163 $4075 7005166 $19 4900 DICK 470310R 239 §5975 BTM 16683 Sold $2.39/ea
30 [Bags Red Small 7to 10 gallon ©oxs0) | 1 5000 000 $54.05 $54.05 9490778 se2s8 258 BH116 $11409 $11400 BTM Fssa612 Sold $114.09/500ct
31 [Bandage Triangular ®ox12) 5 $189 $9480 27549 sold as each $1.58 |  $3.96 si0g0 [ Unitedied UN- sold each $.33 480 $2405 BA2 444 52220 BTM J2051 Sold § 037/ea
32 [Bandage, Olaes 4 inch €y | 5 48 1220 1031947 mondular 1123 s16845 THos076. 1586 790 TACT. OAL4 $459 $68.85 BTM G1188 Sold $4.59/ea
33 [Bandage. Olaes 6 inch Each) 15 748 11220 1032003 mondular si684 25260 105078 17 $10755 TACT OAL'6 $491 $7365 BTM 660525 Sold $4.91/ea
34 [Band-Ad X ©ou/100) | 15 431 $6465 32006 fabric $116 $17.40 1126142 s1.55 225 BA3602 124 $1860 BTM 1122-14960 Sold $124/100ct
35 [Band-Aid 2% 4 ©ox/100) | 15 §713 $10695 2120 fabric $578 58670 1665802 s0ld 50/bx $289 5600 59000 BA334 priced as requested, sold as | g4 5 $18.60 BTM 112214960 Sold $1.24/100ct
36 [Bite Sticks - Plastc ©agno) | 1 s 952 36069 5281 5281 6675231 s381 ) ABED 95 5395 BTM 020010P Sold $3.95/10ct
57 [Blade assembiy,single use, pivoting, purple for 3M surgical clippers | Each) 5 5000 5000 $389 $1945 1392747 sold 50/bx § 19450 | 5414 2070 INsG61 $420 2100 BTM 12262 Sold $4.20/ea
38 [Blast bandage €y | 5 5000 000 a0 $13410 7003730 236 s11040 TACT BLAST $5.30 $79.50 BTM 660235 Sold $5.30/ea
39 [Bone Drill 15 mm needle (EZ-IO)* no substitutions allowed ®Box/5) 5 000 $000 $000 000 No Bid- Exclusive 3000 $0.00 No Bid ‘(E'"m':‘:f““bi:’:'f::m $000 000 Not Bidding NA
40 [Bone Drill 25 mm needle (EZ-10)* no substitutions allowed ®ox/5) 5 $0.00 $0.00 000 No Bid- Exclusive 50 $0.00 No 8id “e":\:::wbi:;‘::?ed $0.00 3000 Not Bidding NA
41 [Bone Drill 45 mm needle €2-10)* no substitutions allowed ®Box/5) 5 000 $000 $000 000 No Bid- Exclusive 000 $0.00 No Bid ‘(E'"m':‘:f““bi:’:'f::m $000 000 Not Bidding NA
42 [Bone Drill Stabilizer (EZ-10)* no substitutions allowed (Each) 5 3000 $0.00 $0.00 000 No Bid- Exclusive 000 $0.00 No 8id “e":\:::wbi:;‘::?ed $0.00 000 Not Bidding NA
43 [Bulb Syringe Each) s 3% $1980 1008422 093 $465 7884757 0% $430 oKar 034 “mn BT 550031 Sold $034/ea
44 [Bumetanide 25 mo/mi 10 mi ©o10 | 5 5000 000 4600 23000 1422085 sa150 saon50 DRE0O7-10 $3476 | 17380 BTM 6007-10 Sold $34.74/10ct
45 [Burn Sheet Each) 5 5000 5000 $135 sos | Unitedmed UM- 5212 $1060 BX91039 s248 $1240 BTM 30061V Sold $248/ea
46 |C2 Morphine 1omg T vial Box/25 1 5000 000 21 sz 1330023 so163 9463 DROTE0-25 $67.68 $67.68 BTM 6127-25 Sold $67.68/25ct
47 5258463110 Calcium chloride 10% 100mg.ml ansyr syringe 10ml each |~ (Each) 2 5000 5000 s1238 21760 1046269 sold 10bx 12380 | s11.10 | s222.00 DR3304-00 substitution $1483 2%60 BTM 371631 Sold $14849/10ct
48 |Cannula Nasal Infant Boys0) | 1 5000 000 s1.40 $1.40 4998042 2113 2113 oms04 $1200 $1400 87M 30056 Sold $028/ea
49 |cAT Tourniquest Each) 2 3023 $60460 s7780 2266 45320 4597780 $2261 | $45220 TQ0001-BLK 2313 260 BTM 1680-23315 Sold §2313/ea
50 [Catheter 14 GA - Braun Intracan Safety @50 | 1 5000 000 $8300 |  $83.00 5077712 $8300 |  s83.00 2594 750 sa7.50 BTM 161284410 Sold $1.75/ea
51 [Catheter 16 GA - Braun Introcan Safety ®oxs) | 1 5000 5000 $8300 | $8300 5070660 $8300 | $83.00 2586 58750 $8750 BTM 161284420 Sold $1.75/ea
52 [Catheter 18GA - Braun Introcan Safety ©ovs0 | 2 5000 000 $8300 | $166.00 9866186 $8300 | $166.00 2560 5750 $175.00 BTM 161284430 Sold $1.75/ea
53 [Catheter 20 GA - Braun Introcan Safety G50 | 3 5000 5000 $8300 | $249.00 5070313 $8300 | s$249.00 2535 58750 26250 BTM 161284450 Sold $1.75/ea
54 [Catheter 22 GA - Braun Intracan Safety G50 | 1 5000 000 $8300 |  $83.00 5075531 $8300 |  $83.00 m2s19 5750 sa7.50 BTM 161284470 Sold $1.75/ea
55 [Catheter 24 GA - Braun Introcan Safety ®oxs) | 1 5000 5000 $8300 | $8300 5070341 $8300 | $83.00 2500 58750 $8750 BTM 161284480 Sold $1.75/ea
56 [Catheter IV Safelet Safety 20 gaugeX1-1/4" Box 50 2 s000 000 $36.40 7280 1264780 $3450 $69.00 6742 P "j:‘f:,“;" sodas| o700 $11400 BTM 1612-84140 Sold $1.14/ea
57 |coban self adherant wrap tan 2 @) [ 2 w301 020 31014 5056 $11.20 9004322 | Henry Schein 9004322 | 174 $3480 BE2 134 2680 BT Fo2s607 Sold $1.34/ea
58 [Coban self adherant wrap tan 3° €y | 2 4528 12672 31015 $0.68 $1632 9004323 | Henry Schein 9004323 | s218 523 BE3 184 16 BTM F925608 Sold $1.84/ea
6o [CPAP Mask - built in nebulizer - FlowSafe £2 Large Adult Mask | go5) | 50 5000 5000 2040 | $1452000 7003324 w6710 | 1335500 octos7318 $213.10 | $10,655.00 |  BTM 313.7555XNEA Sold $42.62/ea
| % Luith novte ant £76iow Moy Nabvsizer Drndluct Ne_t067318
o |CPAP Mask - Large - Flow Safe €2 Small Adult Mask with ports and | g5 1 5000 5000 525040 s2040 7003325 $267.10 526710 ocios7319 $16930 |  $16930 BTM 313.7556XNEA Sold $33.86/ea
62 [COAP Mask - Small - Fow Safe E2 Child Deluxe Mask with portsand | g5 1 5000 5000 $2%040 29040 7003326 526710 | $267.10 MERC 1057320 63900 569,00 BTM 1900-222 Sold $1398/ea
63 [Cric Splitting needle kit - Cook-splitting needies for training Each 6 000 5000 5000 soon N0 B requested $61.91 $371.46 ATo13 substitution 51431 $85.86 BTM 2160-56301 Sold $1431/ea
64 |Cook Cricothyrotomy Catheter Kit Each) 10 5000 5000 5000 soop [N BD- requested si20 | $16200 AT660 substtution $7.36 $73.60 BTM 1639 Sold $73.63/ea
53 f:";‘:‘:"‘ extrication "“")‘:2 :"/f::af‘*"‘ for confined space Each 2 000 5000 $38.90 $77.80 ”"i:::"::d":'m‘ 5871 $117.42 SW2253-GRN substitution 6.6 $13332 BTM 15329 Sold $6.66/ea
67 |Curaplex Halo Chest Seal 2Pack 7 5000 5000 $1319 $9233 7000735 Hyfin 100037 $1857 §13279 TACT HALO 1341 s9367 BTM NART0-0037 Sold $1341/ea
o (oo V Btrion D o e et | Gy | 3 | w0 | sow w2 | e | PP | e | aw a2 wttation sors | s o o | s sors/e
e Case 1 5000 5000 $11.00 sioo [ Unitedhed UM $1450 $1450 OM24003 substitution 5028 5028 BTM 301-107€A Sold $0.28/ea
70 [Cyenekit 5 am Hydroxocobalamin Ki, contains 11V Admin set and [ oy 3 5000 000 s1206 | saes0n 1422286 $996.84 | 299052 DR310-11 s108602 | $325806 TM 031011 Sold $1,086.02/ea
71 [Decompresson needle 375 (needie emergency ai release spear) Each 2 5000 5000 824 $164.80 4997721 2594 $51880 ATO0S1 877 $175.40 BTM NARZZ-0056 Sold $8.77/ea
72 [DEFIB/ECG pads Adult w/quik combo* for lfepack 15 €y | 10 5000 000 $1908 | $190.80 1127163 52053 20530 £L600%3 substtution 2517 25170 87M 236086 Sold $25.17/ea
73 |PEFIB/ECG pads Pediatric w/quik combo *for ffepack 15 €ach [ 10 5000 5000 $1908 | 19080 1127165 52068 520680 160068 substitution 3043 3030 BTM 230107 Sold $3043/ea
74 [Dextrose 5% 100mI/DSW (Pack/4) 3 000 5000 $895 $313.25 1536504 $11.24 $393.40 SL7923-23 "”ce‘:)":":“:ﬁf:::m =l s780 $273.00 BTM 118-2B0087EA Sold $1.95/ea
75 [Dextrose 50% .25 GM (05 mi) Ij Pack/i0 | 8 5000 5000 $1877 | s150.6 1046862 sold 10/bx$187.70 | $13952 | $1.11616 DRTS17-16 sz | s BTM 0074430201 Sold $147.29/10ct
76 [Diltazem 100 mg ADV G0 | 7 5000 000 suoss 598616 1088625 $11024 | $77168 | HOSPDR4350-03 $114%6 so0472 BTM 0409435003 Sold $114.96/10ct
77 |Diphenhydramine 50 mg/mi - nj s |1 5000 5000 2567 2567 1048645 $3058 53058 DRO37625 2354 $2354 BTM 10125 Sold $23.54/25ct
78 [Dopamine HCL in 5% Dextrose Inj 1600 meg/mi (Case/12) 3 s000 000 $32000 596000 9541035 $168.96 | $506.88 DR7809-22 P”‘“’L:l'“":‘:ﬁ'l f:“’ a1 g3 $538.29 BTM AB7809-22 Sold $179.43/12ct
79 [Ear Plugs Go100) | 7 5000 5000 2018 520426 335037 $1679 | $11753 Hp212 2584 $18088 BTM doessa Solde $25.84/100ct
Flectrodes Adult Med! Trac 600 (currentl using Curaplex 420 packin | goy 50 7 5000 000 929 2303 a73835 sold 30/pk 494 1600 200 £1370050 sbstition / prced a5 50,09 5063 BTM 2741-50485 Sold $0.88/100k
81 [Hectrodes Pediatric Medi Trac Gopack [ 2 5000 5000 §535 $1070 5205749 $690 1380 EL6163A priced as requested, wld s | 522 $4.44 BTM 47-31439766PK Sold $1.11/ea
s [fmergency Tape Peditape, for pediatric patients measre lengih | gocp) s 5000 000 286 $11430 1228332 $378 $1890 TX123457 $1531 57655 BTM 3710-16051 Sold $1531/ea
83 [Endotracheal 25 MM Rusch-uncuffed ®o/10 [ 1 5000 5000 $6.70 $6.70 7020463 Sunmed 17330-25 | 1532 1532 e8RS 2250 250 BTM 211320325 Sold $045/ea
&4 [Endotracheal 30 MM Rusch-uncuffed ©ovi) |3 5000 000 670 52010 7002133 Sunmed 1-7320-30 $1532 4596 AE8830 450 $1350 BTM 2113-20330 Sold $0.45/ea
85 [Endotracheal 40 MM Rusch-uncuffed G0 [ 7 5000 5000 $670 4630 as70018 Sunmed 1733040 §1532 $107.24 e840 $450 $3150 BTM 2113-20340 Sold $0.45/ea
86 [Endotracheal 50 MM Rusch-uncuffed ®ovi) | 2 5000 000 670 $1340 as70020 Sunmed 1-7330-50 $1532 064 AE8850 450 $9.00 BTM 2113-20350 Sold $0.45/ea
87 [Endotracheal 5 5mm ®o/10 [ 1 5000 5000 920 920 7002087 Sunmed 1-7333-55 §1776 §17.76 AE9055 $6.70 $6.70 BTM 2113-20255 Sold $0.67ea
88 [Endotracheal 60 MM Rusch ©o10 | 1 5000 000 020 $920 7002088 Sunmed 1-7333-60 $17.76 1776 A£9%60 $6.70 $6.70 BTM 2113-20260 Sold $0.67ea
89 [Endotracheal 65 MM Rusch ®o/10 [ 1 5000 5000 920 920 7002089 Sunmed 1733365 §1776 §17.76 AE%%65 $6.70 $6.70 BTM 2113-20265 Sold $0.67ea
90 [Endotracheal 7.0 MM Rusch ©ov10 | 1 5000 000 020 $920 7002120 Sunmed 1733370 $17.76 1776 AE9970 $6.70 $6.70 BTM 2113-20270 Sold $0.67ea
91 [Endotracheal 7.5MM Rusch ®o/10 [ 1 5000 5000 920 920 002121 Sunmed 1733375 §1776 §1776 AE%97S $6.70 $6.70 BTM 2113-20275 Sold $0.67ea
9 [Endotracheal 80 MM Rusch ©o10 | 1 5000 000 020 $920 002122 Sunmed 1-7333-80 $17.76 1776 AE9%E0 $6.70 $6.70 BTM 2113-20280 Sold $0.67ea
93 [Endotracheal 85 MM Rusch B0 | 12 5000 5000 920 $11040 7002124 Sunmed 1-7333-85 §1776 1312 A£9985 $6.70 $80.40 BTM 2113-20285 Sold $0.67ea




- Description Unit Price | Extended Cost | Vendor Product# |  Comments | Unit Price | Extended Cost | Vendor Product# Comments Unit Price | Extended Cost | Vendor Producti Comments Unit Price | Extended Cost Vendor Product Comments
94 [Endotrachesl 5.0 MM Rusch ©ovi0 | 7 5000 000 020 56440 7002125 Sunmed 1-7333-90 $1776 12432 AE9%90 $6.70 $46.90 BTM 2113-20290 Sold $0.67ea
95 [Endotracheal Tube Holder ®ox10) 1 5000 5000 52830 52830 2202270 sold each 283 $21.10 2710 At priced as requested, 0625 | 52650 $2650 BTM 020500 Sold $2.65/ea
9% [Endotrol 60 MM ©0x/10) 1 5000 5000 5000 5000 o 5000 5000 NOBID sem has been [ 14690 | 14690 BTM 0230605 Sold $14.69/ea
97 [Endotrol 7.0 MM ®ox10) 1 5000 5000 5000 5000 B 5000 5000 NOBID misitemhasbeen | g13630 | 13630 BTM 0230705 Sold $13.63/ea
98 [Endotrol 80 MM ©0x/10) 1 5000 5000 5000 5000 o 5000 5000 NOBID hsiemhas been [ 14710 | s147.0 BTM 0230805 Sold $14.71/ea
99 [epinephrine 1:1,000 Inj - 1 ml ampule ®ox25) 2 5000 5000 $38875 §771.50 1289991 sold 10/bx $15550 | $305.00 | $610.00 DRO103.10 | Priced as requested, sold as | g0 15 561836 B7M 10310 Sold $12367/10ct
100 [Epinephrine 1:10000 1 mg (0.1 mg/mi) Each) ) 5000 000 1179 w1160 118806 sold 10/bx $117.90 $920 $39200 DR33I6-00 $746 | $298.40 BTM 374921 Sold $74.63/10ct
10y |Uncuffed Endotrachael tube without stylette 2 mm size ~No ®ox20 | 1 5000 5000 $2260 $2260 4994999 sold each $1.13 5000 5000 No Bid $4480 80 BTM 792-1-7343-50EA Sold $224/ea
10z |Uncuffed Endotrachael tube 25mm with syltte -No manufacturer | gocq | 4 5000 000 4400 4400 004854 sold each $220 5000 000 No Bid 52460 |  $24.60 BTM 2113-10325 Sold $1.23/ea
103 [ErT Stylet Intubation Rusch 10fr G20 | 2 5000 5000 0220 58440 700499 Dynare 36266 3648 5729 ACS00-10A $1780 | $35.60 BTM 12997 Sold $0.89/ea
104 [ETT Stylet Intubation Rusch 14fr G20 | 2 5000 000 220 $8440 7021879 Dynares 36268 $3648 729 ACS00-14 $1780 | $35.60 BTM 12998 Sold $0.89/ea
105 [ETT Stylet Intubation Rusch 6fr Box/20) 1 5000 5000 0220 220 112404 Dynarex 36265 $5660 $5660 AcB20 ubstition [priced a5 | 517.80 $17.80 BTM 12996 Sold $0.89/ea
106 |Adult Extrication Collar - Curaplex Adult Ref #3151-03161 Case/20 1 s000 000 $91.00 59100 981122 "'"*’“:?“fﬂ”ff‘ old 1 10140 $101.40 CxACE m“‘::’i:‘“‘:";/::f‘::fm $79.00 $79.00 BTM 315103161 Sold $3.95/ea
107 [Pediatric Extrication Collar ~ Curaplex Mini Ref #3151-03163 Caser20 1 $1674 $1674 27397 $91.00 $91.00 9856604 Ambu OURETIES <old 10140 $10140 XN | Jubsttion /priced 2 | 5700 §79.00 BTM 315103163 Sold $395/ea
108 [Eye Pad ©os0 | 1 5000 000 537 4537 626663 1628 628 BATE0 $436 $436 BTM F165626 Sold $4.36/50ct
109 [€2 10 Bone Drill Each) 3 5000 5000 5000 90 | NoBid- Exclusive 5000 5000 No Bid ftem must bepurchased | 5000 5000 Not Bidding NA

110 [Fentanyl - 100mcg/2 mi (Each) 30 000 5000 311 $93.30 1046530 sold 10/bx $31.10 $345 $103.50 sasDRooaz-32 | Priced 'ii‘:ff‘:"' wldas | gq59 $47.70 BTM 379094 Sold $39.74-25¢t
1yg [Ftered Cotheter - 18 gauge blunt fitered fl neecle for drawing | oy 50 1 5000 5000 $8.60 $8.60 1127098 sold 100/bx $17.20 | $1850 1850 moz2 ubstiwtion Jpricedas | gner $1167 BTM 132-3051808X Sold $2334/100ct
13 [r Advance Fiter fine st 7 | acn 2 5000 000 $635 | $127.00 7003830 Salter aMSFS-625 | $1673 33460 PCI_11996-000080 %72 $13440 BTM 174620 Sold $6.72/ea
115 [Foil Emergency Blanket - no manufacturer requested €ach) s 3% $1980 4025 045 $225 9338389 w052 260 Bs1721 045 $225 BTM 12945 Sold $0.45/ea
116 [Glucagon for Injection (Syntheti) Tmg per via Each) 59 000 s2532 | s 1249546 s2m6s | $1231035 DRSES0-00 13003 | $820277 BTM 0593.03 Sold $139.03/ea
18 e - Tve 2 SoTructest - No codng needed2l f gowron) | 17| s000 500 sazs | swors 9007980 o | s Gussziz | beiuton fprced s | g4 | g 8TM 276470721 s0ld $6.14/100ct
19 f,‘,f::‘i‘:::;:ms Box (True 2 GofTruetest - True Metric Pro Only) { go,/100) 50 000 5000 $2616. $1308.00 5700327 sold 50/bx $13.08 $2000 $1,00000 CHIR3HOTP-450 m:zi;‘:‘:ﬂ/g:ﬁi:im $17.68 $884.00 BTM 2763-53050 Sold $8.84/50ct
120 [Glucometer Tes Solution (True 2 GolTruetest - No codingmust be. | cagergy 2 5000 5000 $27.96 $55.92 izt sold each $4.66 52802 §5604 GUTSH0 substitution Jpriced 2 | 5658 $11316 BTM 2762-53060 Sold $943/ea
121 |Glucometer True2go blood glucose meter set ©oun | 15 5000 000 002 5030 5700329 s1052 s1s780 Guase9 substtution 2024 $30260 BTM G70161-K1T Sold $2024/ea
122 [Glucose - Oral 15 Gram Packy) | 9 52 752 1035140 420 $3780 1246672 8 §7047 MD303 357 $32.13 BTM LN7637 Sold $3.57/3pk
123 [Halo Chest seas €@cn [ 10 5000 000 96 59630 4597719 Hyfin 10-0029 s1833 18330 TACT HALO $6.70 $67.00 BTM NAR10-0037 Sold 13.39/pk
124 [Hydrogen Peroxide - 16 0z bottles Coserizy | 4 $131 524 37213 $600 52400 1127069 $1000 4000 MDss 312 $13248 BT™ 25711 Sold $276/ea
125 [ P et ot 14455000 Sincte ot | B 2 5000 5000 a0m $1557 st 1426403 $1260 2520 Dis1 substitution s8.88 $1776 BTM 143166000 Sold $.37/ea
126 [infant/Child Reduced Eneray Defibrilation Electrode Replacement | ~ Each 50 5000 5000 877 | 443850 sBs6a21 a3 | 7w €716 $1809 | $90450 BTM 16383 Sold $18.09/ea
127 [Intravenous (V) stat kit with latex tourniquet €y | 10 5000 000 100 $10000 1277106 $1.48 $1800 meiso 084 $84.00 BTM 660347 Sold $0.84/ea
128 [lodine Prep Pads ®ox20 | 3 5192 2376 1041421 100/b0x $7.44 $2232 2670098 sold 100/bx $3.72 s862 52586 A0 priced as requested, sold s | ga0 52406 BTM 603153 Sold $4.01/100ct
129 [Jpratropium 02% (0.5 mg/25mi) ©o2 | 2 5000 000 464 5928 Te2rte $a57 $9.14 DR9B01-25 62 $924 8TM 370601 Sold $5.54/30ct
130 [V 10 Drop - Amsino fach B 5000 5000 $140 $3920 022312 8 Braun 352630 210 $5880 We10 s0.88 2464 BTM 1712-10830 Sold $0.88/ea
131 |V 60 Drop - Amsino @50 | 1 5000 000 $7650 §7650 4096125 B Braun 352237 s | sires [ $5050 | $5050 BTM 1712-60830 Sold $1.01/ea
T [ o s o st wieme s b | e | | W saco s w2 | smo | PremEmewn | o | o s 79 | 3w o 73081 sad s073/e8
133 [V Flush Normal Saline, 1om prefiled syringe (100 n box, 4boxes |, 2 5000 000 000 5000 s | s DROBDS 5036 072 BTM 1920-01010 Sold $0.36/ea
134 [Sendrick Extrication Device and Individual pieces o sterle. (€ach) 3 5000 5000 3890 | s11670 | Uniedhted UM $6653 20079 o1 substitution 1241 723 BTM 660030 Sold $14241/ea
135 [Kerlix 6 ply Large 4-1/2'x4-1/8 yd. Ref #6715 (steile) £ach P %616 s 27022 075 $1800 8403994 Dukal 645 s1.58 19 BAGTIS 094 52256 BTMI121-36605 Sold $094/ea
136 [cerlx gauze sterite 6 ply 45%4 €ach) 2 5000 5000 s072 $144 1131735 sold 100/cs 7200 | $158 16 BAGTIS 034 $188 BTM 1121-36645 Sold $094/ea
137 [Kerliz Gauze bandage ral, non-strie, large, 4 5inXa.1 yard Box s 5000 000 6225 an2s 1084644 100/ suaze | a0 BAGTI6 priced as case/100 067 $335 BTM 112136545 Sold $0.67/ea
136 [king Airway device LTS.D Size 4 €ach) 6 | s [ seww 5316 3000 48000 7002657 $2976 | $47616 Aca404 157 450512 BT 2114-44434 Sold $31.57/ea
139 [King Airway device LTS-D Size 5 Each) B | w22 | e 183096 3000 454000 7002658 $2076 | $535.68 Ac4d05 15 456626 BTM 211444435 Sold $3157/ea
140 [King 2" Individually Wrapped G | 3 5000 5000 22 $687 2670033 29 879 w702 $171 $5.13 BTM 112136554 Sold $1.71/12pk
141 [Kiing 3" Individually Wrapped G | 3 5000 000 266 7% 4990614 ) $1059 81703 5226 $678 BTM 112136555 Sold $2.26/12pk
142 [King 4" Individually Wrapped G | 3 5000 5000 5289 5867 8406322 sold Bbw/cs $2312 | 420 $1260 81704 308 920 BTM 1121-36556 Sold $308/12pk
143 [Labetalol HCI Inj 100 mg/20 mi MDY Each) 2 5000 000 302 $60.40 1406893 .18 1360 DR9G22-01 31 96620 8TM 056629 Sold $3.31/ea
144 [Laerdal AC/DC Adaptor charger W/O power cord - 88611 fach B sz | sesse 54258 11009 | ss95.05 4998758 886112 172 | $76860 oxessTn $65.11 sa2555 BT™ 222311188 Sold $165.11/ea
145 |Laerdal Compact suction unit LCSU 4 - 800mI e 4 5000 000 203 | 20812 4008735 $49533 | 198132 OK880051 s | 237908 BTM 2221.51088 Sold $59477/ea
146 [Laryngoscope Handle IU-Metal-Fiberaptic Greenline Re-usable LED | ~ Each s 5000 5000 s2837 | s11ss 4992393 53949 si97.45 LyiF 4727 523635 BTM 792:5.0236.09 Sold $47.27/ea
147 [LCSU 4 power cord 12VDC Each) s 5000 000 5281 526405 002197 $5133 | $256.65 OK884500 5202 26010 87M 834500 Sold $52.02/ea
148 [Lidocaine HCI Ij Syringe 100 mg 20 mg/mi) Packii) | 2 5000 5000 7843 $15686 1191697 56475 12050 DR300 ss213 | 10426 BTM 0074490301 Sold $52.13/10ct
149 [Lidocaine Jelly 2% 5 ml G0 | 3 5000 000 52053 | 58859 1223399 s7961 204 DROTIN-3T $5893 $17679 87M 301200 Sold $147.32/25ct
150 |Lifepak 15 paper - 60 rols per case Case 2 5000 5000 $12220 528440 7006155 sold 5/bx $11.85 $1200 $26400 EL23ULPT1 priced as requested, wld 35 | 59120 | 19240 BTM 274510108 Sold $1.52/ea
151 [Lfestar EC. il White Exteror/lue interfor, povderfree 12101 ¢ w 5000 000 210 | 75480 7002471 20000 | 3880000 GLotoa. $195.00 | $8580.00 BTM 1015-10403 Sold $19.50/100ct
152 [[resar £C, itrlle, White Exteior/olue interior,powder free, 120 | o 19 5000 5000 21 | $421230 7002470 20000 | $380000 GLotoam $19500 | $3.705.00 BTM 1015-10402 Sold $19.50/100ct
153 |LfeStar EC. il White Exteror/lue interfor, povderfree 1210 1 ¢ s 5000 000 210 | 110850 7002469 20000 | 100000 GLotoss $19500 | $975.00 BTM 101510401 Sold $19.50/100ct
154 [[estar EC, Nitele White Exterior/olue interior, powder free, 12n | cago » 5000 5000 210 | 55250 7002472 20000 | 8500000 GLotoaxL $19500 | $4.875.00 BTM 1015-10404 Sold $19.50/100ct
155 |LfeStar EC. il White Exteror/lue interfor, povderfree 12101 ¢ s 5000 000 210 | 110850 7002473 20000 | 100000 GLotoaxL $19500 | $975.00 BTM 101510405 Sold $19.50/100ct
156 [Mac 2 - Metal Fiber Optic Green Systems Handles - Disposable ®ox10) 5 5000 5000 $3270 | 16350 8579052 sold each $3.27 §57.20 528600 Lyss2 priced as requested, s0ld s | g3a10 $19050 BTM 301-B3020EA Sold $381/ea
157 [Mac 3 - Metal Fiber Optic Green Systems Handles - Disposable Each) s 5000 000 327 $1635 8572059 572 2860 Lves3 ) $1905 BTM 301-830306 Sold $381/ea
156 [Mac 4 - Metal Fiber Optic Green Systems Handles - Disposable €ach) 5 5000 5000 $327 $1635 8571785 72 2860 Lyasa 381 $1905 BTM 301-B3040EA Sold $381/ea
159 |Magil Forceps Adult Each) 3 5000 000 450 $1350 7001188 w2 s272 Na7S 5383 $11.49 BTM 0129 Sold $3.83/ea
160 [Magil Forceps pediatrc €ach) 3 5000 5000 $450 $1350 7001190 w2 s1272 IN374 5283 $8.49 BT 0128 Sold $2.83/ea
161 [Magnesium Sulfate Inj SO0%(0.5 G/mi) 10 ml SDL Mays) | 1 5000 000 se281 s6261 131652 $5450 | $5450 DRO0G4-11 s5572 45572 BTM 064-11 Sold $55.72/25ct
162 [Manual B Cuff Adult (€ach) 1 $1511 s511 56336 s5.24 $5.24 7020308 24 5724 MSLMS 87100 679 4679 BT™ 36012 Sold $6.79/ea
163 [Manual 89 cutf child Each) 1 2379 279 se33s $5.06 $5.06 7020309 5724 124 MSLMS-8300 679 1679 87M 36011 Sold $6.79/ea
164 [Manual B Cuff nfant (€ach) 1 5000 5000 $i0200 | 545200 7020310 724 §71.24 MSLMS 87400 5679 $679 BTM 36010 Sold $6.79/ea
165 [Manusl 89 Cuff Large Adult - No manufacturer requested Each) 1 2379 279 sex37 $5.44 $5.44 7020307 1806 5206 MSLMS-8200 679 1679 87M 36014 Sold $6.79/ea
166 |Masimo Ambient light shield sensor Each 5 5000 000 s1.70 $8.50 7005325 sold 10/pk $17.00 a7 5856 POITISS Jubstiution Fpriced 2 | sng2 $5911 BTM 11171000054 Sold §59.1/5pk
167 |[esmo SET HNCS Adus Adhesive Sensor, Disposable Adult Greater |- oy | 10 5000 5000 1178 §117.80 1911 sold 20/bx $235.60 snor s1970 P02508 s1114 | s11140 BTM 2712-04126 Sold $11.14/ea
16 Y25 SE7 LNCS Pt Adhesive Sensor, Disposable, Pediatric € | 10 5000 5000 s1234 | 12340 4996226 sold 20/bx $246.80 | 1254 $12540 PO2510 $1564 $156.40 BTM 271202020 Sold $15 64/ea
169 [Masimo Set M-LNCS Adix Adhesive Sensor, Adult - 1860 Each 2 5000 000 117 2356 7002258 sold 20/bx $235.60 sngr 2304 PO1859 s111a | s2228 BTM 2712-04126 Sold $11.14/ea
170 [Masimo Shield Ambient SPO2 Rainbow Sensors disposable 10 pk 1 5000 5000 $17.00 $17.00 7005325 same as #166 $5.70 $5.70 Po2357 substitution / priced 28 | 50933 560833 BTM 271233596 Sold $608.33/10ct
171 |Mask Face Shield Box/50) 1 000 5000 $3046 $30.46 1047321 sold 25/bx $15.23 $5000 $5000 10 priced as requested. 0ld a5 | 11900 $119.00 BTM 4851 Sold $239/ea
172 |Mask NRBM Adult Bow50) 2 5000 5000 $29.00 ssgoo [ Unitedied UN- 142 8284 OMm25060 $35.00 §7000 BTM 30052 Sold $0.70/ea
173 [ Mask NRBM Child ©0w50) 1 5000 5000 $29.00 sago0 | Unitedied UN- $67.16 $67.16 Om2s0s8 $35.00 $35.00 BTM 533-Mis 2505864 Sold $0.70/ea
174 |Mask NRBM Infant. ®owzs) | 10 5000 5000 $3550 §35500 4508044 s0ld each $142 @325 $33250 OM25055 priced as requested, 91335 | 52325 | s23250 BTM 30058 Sold $0.93/ea
175 [ Meconium Aspirator Each) s 5000 000 585 52025 1376689 4507 52535 oxoon $459 52295 BTM 590101 Sold $4.59/ea
176 |Medsource Advanced patient mover - Ms-95202 Each) EY 5000 5000 $8.80 s17600 | Unitediied UN- s1582 31640 MsLMs9s0p | Priced asrequested, sold a5 f gy, 57 s2540 BTM 3246-12345 Sold $1227/ea
177 |Medsource Instan Hesd immobolizer, Adu't - MS-91010 Coseso [ 1 5000 000 $18000 |  $18000 7000879 w00 | sw0 MSLMS91010 1800 | $18800 BTM 3141.91010 Sold $3.76/ea
17g |Meret Anway bag - MERET Omni ProX BLYALS Total System (152 Each 2 5000 5000 §256.66 $51332 7005608 Blue 526674 $53348 Cs8101-8LU s9412 | 18824 BTM 252310116 Sold $94.12/ea
179 [Meret Intubation Roll (Meret Pro A Tac black) Each 2 5000 000 s0s6 | seori2 7004040 s9274 s18548 css101ATE $7302 | $146.04 BTM 252251032 Sold §73.02/ea
180 |Midazolam (VERSED) Class IV, 10mb, 2 m vial Each) s 5000 5000 a7 5875 1277906 s0ld 10/bx $17.50 $1.28 $6.40 DRosga-gs [Priced @ requested. Soldas| g, 49 $701 BT 371113 Sold $1402/10ct
181 [Miler 0 - Metal Fiber Optic Green Systerns Handies - Disposable Each) s 5000 000 327 $1635 8575362 572 2860 Lveso ) $1905 BTM 301-831006A Sold $381/ea
182 [Miler 1 - Metal Fiber Optic Green Systems Handies - Disposable (€ach) s 5000 5000 $327 $1635 8571425 572 52860 Lya61 381 51905 BTM 301-B31106A Sold $381/ea
183 [Miller 2 - Metal Fber Optic Green Systems Handles - Disposable Each) s 5000 000 327 $1635 8575266 572 2860 Lvee2 ) $1905 BTM 301-831208A Sold $381/ea
184 [Miler 3 - Metal Fiber Optic Green Systems Handies - Disposable (€ach) s 5000 5000 $327 $1635 8573605 72 2860 Lvas3 381 $1905 BTM 301-B31306A Sold $381/ea
185 [MLNCS disposable pediatrc finger probes boxes 3 5000 000 567 s70701 900268 w2080 | 15240 PO1860 priced as box/20 $1354 | $4062 BTM 2712-25110 Sold $13.54/ea
186 [MLNCS finger probe - Master Medical Equipment 2712-25010 fach 15 5000 5000 sz | si6s0 46777 §1s540 | 8233100 Po2501 s2118 | 31770 BTM 2712-29190 Sold $21.18/ea
187 |Mouthpiece Spirometer Virobac Il (for BM bags) Case s000 000 $51.90 s000 281348 20es $38.80 5000 om2862 :2'::/‘ :""“’ = 000 s000 Not Bidding NA

186 [Multi Trauma Dressing G2 [ 2 5000 5000 s1775 | s3550 7005968 sold each $.71 2119 5438 BAIO0 2425 4850 BT 16353 Sold $097/EA
169 [Nail Polish Remover pads ®ovi) | 2 792 s1s84 104611 519 $1038 1412429 5286 572 AL20 $561 s122 BTM 279-15018X Sold $5.61/8X
190 [Naloxane Hydrochloride 1 ma/mi Packii0) | 1 5000 5000 siwe0 | 16260 1182155 15960 | $159.60 DR3369-00 §8264 $18264 BTM 371215 Sold $18264/BX
191 [Narcotic box, clear top with lock, 7.25in L X 625in W X 1.125 H £ach 2 000 o779 $195.58 7002533 3123 6246 D100 $3088 |  $6176 BTM CNB-100 Sold $30.88/EA
192 [Nesephanyngeal Away 24 FR Ainway Nasopharyngeal 4R 85mm | go,ig) | ¢ $1233 $1233 54248 $17.20 s1720 | UnmitedMed UM- §1735 §1795 AB43954 substitution §1560 $1560 BTM 2021-14660 Sold $1.56/EA
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193 |Nasogastric Tube 08 FR ®ox/10) 2 s000 000 7520 $15040 8903208 $3.00 $6.00 0K9508C :‘ffj:‘;"‘:’;; :?t‘::‘ 000 s000 Ne Not bidding
194 |Nasogastric Tube 12 FR ®ox10) 1 5000 000 £21.00 52100 8900566 sold each 5210 $1450 $1450 oKs212 priced asrequested, <0ld 35| 11,09 $11.00 BTM 211431412 Sold $1.10/EA
195 |Nasogastric Tube 14 FR ®ox/10) 1 s000 000 2100 2100 8900565 sold each §210 $1450 $1450 oKs214 priced as 'i‘:f:j:“‘ oldas | 511,00 $11.00 BTM 211471114 Sold $1.10/EA
196 |Nasogastric Tube 16 FR ®ox10) 2 5000 000 $2070 s41.40 8396143 sold each §207 $1450 $29.00 oKs216 priced asrequested, <0ld 35| 11,09 $22.00 BTM 211432216 Sold $1.10/EA
197 |Nasopharyngeal Airway 12 FR ®ox/10) 2 s000 000 $17.20 $3440 ”“i‘:";’:’:ir"""" 2145 4290 A2 $19.10 820 BTM 023312 Sold $1.91/EA
198 |Nasopharyngeal Airway 14 FR ®ox10) 2 5000 000 $17.20 $3440 Unitedivied UM 2145 $4290 AB614 $15.60 $31.20 BTM 2021-14630 Sold $1.56/EA
199 [Nasopharyngeal Airway 16 FR ®Box/10) 1 000 5000 $17.20 $17.20 “"“ej‘M‘ij M 2145 2145 AB6T6 $15.60 $15.60 BTM 2021-14635 Sold $1.56/EA
200 [Nasopharyngeal Airway 18 FR ®ox10) 1 5000 000 $17.20 $1720 Unitedivied UM 2145 2145 AB618 $15.60 $15.60 BTM 2021-14640 Sold $1.56/EA
201 |Nasopharyngeal Airway 20 FR ®Box/10) 1 000 5000 $17.20 $17.20 “"“ej‘M‘ij M $17.95 $17.95 AB43950 $15.60 $15.60 BTM 2021-14650 Sold $1.56/EA
202 [Nasopharyngeal Airway 22 FR ®ox10) 1 5000 000 $17.20 $1720 Unitedived UM $17.95 $17.95 AB43952 $15.60 $15.60 BTM 2021-14655 Sold $1.56/EA
0 |Nasopharyngeal Airway 26 FR ®Box/10) 1 000 5000 $17.20 $17.20 “"“ej‘M‘ij M $17.95 $17.95 AB43956 $15.60 $15.60 BTM 2021-14665 Sold $1.56/EA
204 [Nasopharyngeal Airway 28 FR ®ox10) 1 $2.64 $2.64 1032018 $1721 1721 Unitedived UM $17.95 $17.95 AB43958 $1560 $1560 BTM 2021-14670 Sold $1.56/EA
205 |Nasopharyngeal Airway 30 FR ®Box/10) 1 000 5000 $17.20 $17.20 “"“i;’??ifﬂ“” $17.95 $17.95 AB43%60 $15.60 $15.60 BTM 2021-14675 Sold $1.56/EA
206 |Nebuiizer (T-piece) €ach) 1 5000 5000 5058 soss [ Unitedied UM- 5082 s082 Omiga3 $03 ©30 BTM 512-BVMNEBKIT Sold $303EA
207 |Needle 18 GA - 1 172" 1.20 x 38 mm ©oin | 1 5000 000 $3.45 $345 9004471 wun 412 mecA 52550 52559 BTM 1641-76618 Sold $25.59/8X
20g [Necle 22 GA -1 1/2" 103 38 mm - No manufacturer requested | goyiop | 1 5000 5000 155 $155 1127101 412 sa12 T226A 52559 52559 BTM 132-3057638X Sold $2559/8X
209 [Needle 25 GA - 1 1/2' 05 x 1.58 mm ©oin | 1 5000 000 $334 $334 9004472 2323 223 3051278 52550 52559 BTM 1641.76725 Sold $25.59/8X
210 [Needle Decompression 14Gx 325 €ach) 10 5000 5000 B2 58420 ass7rt $807 58070 AT00S6 877 $87.70 BTM NARZZ-0056 Sold $T7/EA
211 |Nitrolingual Pump Spray 25 400 meg per spray 90 doses Each " 5000 000 §1420 | 262140 1410747 60 doses suGds | 248065 DRO4I0.04 8839 | $150263 BTM 0120-49 Sold $88.39/EA
212 |02 ey €ach) 10 5000 093 930 450566, 5089 850 orss 024 240 BTM 111888K Sold $0.24/EA
213 [obstetrcs Kits caserto) |1 $11630 $11630 0385 sold as each 1163 |  $5350 45350 7537874 45005 55005 KTS00LF 4720 $47.20 BTM 540-1721EA Sold $4.72/EA
214 [oralpharyngeal Airway 100 MM Purple Adult (Each) 5 5061 305 si077 %025 s1.25 1412441 RED 030 150 AnTs05 014 5070 BTM 2010-34100 Sold $0.14/EA
215 [oralpharyngeal Airway 40 MM Pink Neanatal (Each) 5 052 260 si073 5021 $1.05 as70640 020 150 AnTo01 014 5070 BTM 2010-34040 Sold $0.14/EA
216 [Oralpharyngeal Ainway 50 MM Blue Infant. (Each) s 5061 05 ss777 %021 $1.05 as70650 030 150 AnTs01 014 5070 BTM 201034050 Sold $0.14/EA
217 [oralpharyngeal Airway 60 MM Black Child (Each) 5 078 90 ss779 5021 $1.05 as70660 020 150 Anto02 014 5070 BTM 2010-34060 Sold $0.14/EA
218 [oralpharyngeal Airway 70 MV White Adult Each) s 5000 5000 %021 $1.05 as70670 030 150 AnTs025 014 5070 BTM 2010-34070 Sold $0.14/EA
219 [Oralpharyngeal Airway 80 MM Green Adult (Each) 5 s1.31 5655 s475 %025 $1.25 1412405 020 150 AnTo03 014 5070 BTM 2010-34080 Sold $0.14/EA
220 [Oralpharyngeal Airway 50 MM Yellow Adult (Each) s 131 5655 54076 %025 125 1412437 030 150 AnTS04 014 5070 BTM 201034090 Sold $0.14/EA
221 [0xygen Regulator with Tee Each) s 5000 000 2750 $137.50 1415203 s2662 | $13310 068725 sasa 522570 BTM 14288 Sold $45.14/EA
222 |Oxygen Tubing ®oxs) | 1 5000 5000 1850 $1850 as77Bt 2102 2002 omzon $1400 $14.00 BTM 301-100EA Sold $0.28/EA
223 [pediatric Stethoscope Each) 2 5000 000 s461 922 004813 $3400 56800 ST604-8LU 5263 $5.26 BTM 130708K Sold $2.63/EA
24 [pen Lights (€ach) 6 769 614 91326 053 $3.18 7020583 w0n 2 PLiOG 5064 XS 8TM 32762 Sold $383/PK
225 [personal protection Gown Each) s s1.31 5655 1020143 5070 $350 1016214 sold 50/cs $35.00 s1.41 105 Icas76 101 4505 87M 291576 Sold S101/EA
226 [Posey Restrants @) | s 5000 5000 $313 $15.65 7004728 Dick Medical 501110 [ 5432 2160 sx2s10 79 $1895 BTM 501110 Sold $379/PR
227 [posi-flush Syringe Saline - Prefiled NaCl 10ml Flush with luer lock | ®ox/20 | 1 5000 000 s1627 s1627 ag70317 $1469 1469 DR30GS-44 $10.80 $1080 BTM 1920-01010 Sold $0.36/EA
225 [pressure nfuser €ach) 2 5000 5000 708 $14.16 1229815 sold 5/bx § 3540 s1872 744 14010 678 $1356 BTM 350310 Sold $6.78/EA
220 [pro Splint Product (Complete Set) # AE-1800 Each) 4 5000 000 $18539 §7u156 1148707 $185.49 74196 P39 s1a122 | sseass BTM 526-113996 Sold $141.22/EA
230 [Quikclot ACS sponge. (ach) 10 5000 000 000 5000 ose $3237 $323.70 BAT350 3511 $351.10 BTM G1284 Sold $35.11/EA
231 5579‘;;3‘7‘:;332‘?\""",3‘::: i?/i‘gf‘:ﬂ“:ﬁ:‘ item-Medline HCSSATSM | ¢,y 10 000 5000 $27.50 $275.00 1415203 repeat of #221 $24.36 $243.60 0628415 substitution $4517 $451.70 BTM 14288 Sold $45.17/EA
232 |Reguiator Oxygen Mini Each s 5000 5000 $2284 | 11420 4997655 52436 $12180 0628515 2358 $117. BT 661065 Sold $2358/EA
233 [fing Cutter Each) s s5267 526435 36316 $499 52495 3782372 1660 3200 N%D 584 52020 87M 400010 Sold $584/EA
234 [Royal Blue Cenvical Colar Bag Each) s 5000 5000 2612 $13060 404633 $2496 | $12480 o780 3007 $15035 BTM 260207 Sold $30.07/EA
235 [sager Spiint Bilateral Each) 3 5000 000 sm0x | s auzsrr e | 820526 P304 $481.98 | $1445.94 BTM 660202 Sold $481.98/EA
235 [scoop Stretcher - Auminum €ach) 1| so0sts [ 100818 s34 $53845 $53845 7002784 $57985 §57985 SWossMB $36992 | s369.92 BTM 14781 Sold $369.92/EA
237 [sharps Box -5 QT. Kendall-model 85131 Each) 2 673 13460 0636 70 59400 6666741 4528 $10560 Isgs131 461 $9220 BTM 58108513 Sold $4.61/EA
236 [sharps Dart Needle Holder Each) 5000 5000 $1.43 $286.00 7004494 Dynarex 4630 sharps | 1 $3200 ISDART $1.44 528800 BTM 64250 Sold $144/EA
239 [smart Capnoine Plus Cannula, Adult/intermediate Each 120 5000 000 $5.55 $666.00 7003834 Sahter aMSF1-7-6:25 | 81131 $1,357.20 PossE2 s09% | 131520 BTM 691-11996000162€ Sold $1096/EA
240 [Smart CapnoLine plus Cannula, Pediatrc/intermediate fach ) 5000 5000 $539 $161.70 7021677 |Salter amsr2-pED-7-6-25| 51559 46770 PO67269 %672 520160 BTM 174620 Sold $672/EA
241 [Sodium Bicarb Inj 8/4% 50 meq (1meg/m) Each) s 5000 000 210 $11050 1402632 sold 0 22100 | $15.40 | $77.00 DR3352-00 s16084 584920 BTM 376637 Sold $169.84/8X
242 [Sodium Chioride 5% 100 mi Adv Packiy) | 5 5000 5000 $1460 7300 1045663 sold 50/cs $146,00 $1305 $6525 surion67 1045 $52.25 BTM 358437 Sold $2.09/EA
243 [Sodium Chioride 1000 Bag- Braun ©o12 | 10 5000 000 4056 440560 1002808 $3697 3670 SL7800.09 $3348 | $33480 BTM 7800-09 Sold $2.79/EA
244 |Sodium Chioride 1000 BT - Braun ®ox12) 1 5000 5000 $3972 3972 5075300 sold each $331 or T6/cs | $37.20 $37.20 s15200 priced 2s requested, 045 | 53209 $32388 BTM G0914 Sold $2.74/EA
245 [Sodium Chioride 500 Bag- Braun ©o2h | 1 5000 000 sar12 sa112 1004737 7614 7614 steoot 56696 $66.96 BTM 358001 Sold $2.79/EA
245 [Solumedrol s |1 5000 5000 28137 28137 3820015 522088 | $22088 DRO047-22 2886 22886 BTMO403.0047-22 Sold $228.86/BX
247 [sair Chair - MS-90044 (Each) 1 5000 5000 s15765 | sisres | Unitedied M- 452680 $526.80 Swoo0 sa01.02 sa01.02 8TM 30062 Sold $401.02/EA
245 [statpack G3 cel (small bag) - G310018U fach ) 5000 5000 s [ s10m40 001716 s7797 | s1.01361 F$31001-8LU w27 | 105651 BTM 2524-03402 Sold §8127/EA
249 [statpack G3 cel Intravenous bag Each 1 5000 000 @73 s273 001716 same as above s7797 s1797 F$31001-8LU o127 sz BTM 252403402 Sold $8127/EA
250 [Sterile Water 1000 Bt - Braun Gote) [ 2 $1379 2758 57097 a0 $9888 5075000 635 59270 s15000 5409 9152 BTM Go912 Sold §256/EA
251 ittman Classic I Stethoscope Each) 0 5000 000 o710 $971.00 1228518 s213 2130 sTs620 384 $38.40 BTM 36025 Sold $3.84/EA
252 [Littman Classic I Pediatic Stethoscope. €ach) 10 5000 5000 $8568 485650 778706 $7975 | $79750 sT2119 $86.02 $96020 BTM 172113 Sold $86.02/EA
253 [Stopcock 4 way - Part # 118-206242 Each) 10 s000 000 $061 $6.10 1192317 e “::‘,:‘"‘fiﬁf“n?“ sis1 $15.10 0626242 priced as reauened sold e | sars w160 BTM 1812-25103 Sold $4.16/EA
254 [sylette disposable adult lorge 7.0 to 100 Each) 10 5000 5000 21 2110 700499 w301 3010 Acs00 5208 $2080 BTM 020404 Sold $2.08/EA
255 [stylette disposable pediatric 2mm-3 1/2mm Each) 0 5000 000 w21 2110 1412404 w28 2830 ace0 114 $11.40 BTM 2120-20411 Sold $1.14/EA
256 [suction Big Sticks €ach) s 5000 5000 261 $1305 7002487 255 $1275 OHa024 257 $1285 BTM 594241 Sold §257/EA
257 [suction canister, 800 ML for LCSU 4 Each) s 5000 000 5276 $13.80 6455651 $1964 9020 oKass102 3507 $17535 BTM 21286102 Sold $3507/EA
255 [Suction Catheter 06 FR (€ach) 10 5000 5000 %025 250 700452 028 280 o306 013 $130 BTM 36090 Sold $0.13/EA
259 [suction Catheter 08FR Each) 2 5000 000 %025 4500 021414 028 5560 oK3608 0413 5260 BTM 36091 Sold $0.13/EA
260 [Suction Catheter 10 FR (€ach) K 5000 5000 %025 @7 7021415 s028 308 oK3610 013 143 BTM 36092 Sold $0.13/EA
261 [suction Catheter 12 FR Each) 3 5000 000 %025 325 7021416 028 364 o612 0413 $1.69 BTM 36093 Sold $0.13/EA
262 [Suction Catheter 14 FR (€ach) 1 5000 5000 %025 025 021417 028 $028 o314 013 5013 BTM 36094 Sold $0.13/EA
263 [suction Catheter 16 FR Each) 0 5000 000 %025 50 021418 028 840 K616 0413 $390 BTM 36095 Sold $0.13/EA
264 [Suction Tubing (€ach) 5 5000 5000 s 4555 2374 sold 50/cs $55.50 5076 $380 OHaz50 084 9420 BT 16106 Sold SOB4EA
265 [syringe 1 cC ©owt00) | 2 5000 000 $9.08 $18.16 1386993 $1200 2200 Mt $56.00 $11200 BTM 661083 Sold S0S6/EA
266 [syringe 12 cC. ®ox/B0) 2 5000 5000 s7.84 $15.68 7005969 | Pynarex 6990, 10cc sold 1049 52080 mioccLLs priced 25 requested, 013 %5 | 51260 $2560 BTM 1633-26510 Sold $0.16/EA
267 |syringe 20 cC. G0 | 4 5000 000 $8.00 $3200 7005973 5950 340 maoccLL $1450 45800 BTM 163320720 Sold $029/EA
265 [syringe 3 cC G100 | 3 5000 5000 618 $1854 9004475 s727 2181 26200 800 52400 BTM 163330303 Sold S00B/EA
269 [syringe 35 C. ©ox/3) s 5000 000 081 $405 700597z |Pynrex €992 30cc sold | g5 §1575 msceLL priced as requested, sold as | gy 4 720 BTM 62735057 Sold S048/EA
270 [syringe 60 cc ®ox2s) | 3 5000 5000 1067 $3201 7005970 176 3528 meoccLL 2700 58100 BTM 620060 Sold $1.08/EA
271 [rape 1" Clotn ©ovia | 5 $1186 $5930 20081 826 w30 4990655 s957 785 AT $7.84 $39.20 BTM 1110-14007 Sold $7.84/BX
272 [rape 1" Transpore G [ s 52995 1975 2110 1220 56100 777305 $14.40 7200 TATB27-1 $1038 $51.90 BTM 151527 Sold $10.38/BX
273 [rape 12" Cloth G2 | 5 s17.62 810 20280 si018 45090 1012025 s957 785 TATIO $7.84 $39.20 BTM 1110-14006 Sold $7.84/BX
274 [Tape 2" Cloth ®oxe | 10 s1762 17620 208 826 $260 7005574 $957 9570 TATIT2 $784 $78.40 BTM 1110-14008 Sold $7.84/BX
275 [rape 2" Transpore. ©ox/6) s 5000 000 $1220 $61.00 7779422 $1440 7200 TATERT-2 1438 790 BTM 1515272 Sold $1438/8X
276 [Temporal Scanner TAT-5000 Temporal artery thermometer infrared | (Each) 2 5000 5000 36709 77418 413 $34830 | $696.60 THS000 920 8404 BTM 175000 Sold §392.02/EA
277 [Tetracaine Hydrochloride 0.5% 2 mi ®ox/12) 1 s000 000 $31032 | 31032 1384402 Smi sold each $25.86 | $55200 $55200 DROT2Z-T0 priced as f:‘f‘j‘n‘“‘ B 595364 BTM 372121 Sold §79.47/EA
278 [Thiamine Hydrochloride Ing 100 mo/mi 2 mi s | 1 5000 5000 s15223 | s15223 1418474 2%600 529600 DRe22825 2930 290 BTM 371651 Sold $293.02/PK
279 [Tongue Blades Sterle @100 | 1 793 193 0254 636 4636 1000238 357 s 8A30%0 s3.42 342 BTM 279-43148X Sold $3.42/BX
2680 [Trauma Shears ®ox10) 2 $96.90 19380 36106 s0ld as each 969 | $5.60 s11z0 [ Unitedied UM- sold each $.56 $840 $1680 INSS5-BLK priced 2 requested, g s | gq70 $13.40 BTM 2811.05527 Sold $067/EA
261 [Trage Tags Packis0) | 1 sa325 @25 %0670 si065 065 900468 s2856 2856 ™02 2824 $2824 BTM 14522 Sold $28.24/BG
252 [TRUE METRIX® Control Solution Level 1 RHO1-1 fach 10 $145 $11450 1006624 $466 4660 1254034 467 $4670 GUTS400 436 $43.60 BTM 1450-01 Sold $4.36/EA
263 [TRUE METRIX® Control Solution Level 2 RSHO1-2 Each 0 5000 000 $4.66 $46.60 1254035 e 670 Gu7S42 000 5000 Not Bidding Not bidding
284 True-Metrix Pro-Professional monitoring blood glucose system. fach 10 213 524130 1006626 5002 $020 5700329 $1052 $10520 GuBiE 956 59560 BTM 1474.03 Sold $9S6/EA
285 |vaseline Gauze 318" G | 3 $396 s11.88 1035351 a8 s2667 1286079 5950 2880 B4 5096 52068 BTM 150061K1 Sold S083/EA
286 [Window Punch, aluminum barrel, center /8 inch Dx5 inch L (€ach) 5 5000 5000 126 3630 4990656 $6.50 $3250 4202 $657 285 BTM G1741 Sold $6.57/EA
267 [Yankaver Suction Tip Cose 1 5000 000 250 2250 112388 soves 26 28 a0 priced as case/s0 041 5041 BTM 16107 Sold $0.41/EA
255 [Vellow Blankets - Rain Blankets (€ach) 2 5000 5000 si68 533 700582 20 $404 BS703A s163 $326 BTM 16570 Sold $1.63/EA




# | Description | I:':'::: st Yoy | it price |aﬂmdad Cost | Vendor Product# | Comments | unit Price | Extended Cost |Vu|dur Product# | Comments. Unit Price |aﬂmdad Cost | Vendor Product# | Comments. Unit Price | Extended Cost | Vendor Product# | Comments

269 [zofran 4 mg/2 mi Inj Vil [[aaes | 0o [ ww | | s | snas [ e | s1032 | sw3z | omersoos | see | swe | BTM 475502 [ sota sseovex
TOTAL BID AMOUNT $13,192.60 $97,108.28 $98,836.99 $81,770.81

20 ‘Sh\ppmg charge for 24 hour delivery | Flat Fee | 1 5000 ‘ 5000 | | 5000 | soop  [feebasedon | §75.00 ‘ §75.00 | ‘nsw every 15 Ibs 5000 | 5000 ‘Eas@d on order sizemeight |

291 ‘Sh\ppmg charge for 72 hour delivery | Flat Fee | 1 000 ‘ 5000 | | 5000 | 000 ‘@f bf o e | 000 ‘ 5000 | ‘No Charge 5000 | 000 Based on order size/weight |

MULTIPLE VENDORS WITH LOW.
AWARDED
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